SWAMI

This is only a tabulation of prices submitted and is not an indication of award or responsiveness.

CITY OF MIAMI GARDENS

April 5, 2012 @ 2:00PM

ITB #11-012-022 -PURCHASE AND DELIVERY OF OEM TONERS

CVR Computer Supplies

R& H Photo Video

The Tree House, Inc.

NHS Enterprises, LLC

Staples

Cherry Hill, NJ NY, NY Newton, MA Aventura, FL Pembroke Park, FL
BROTHER Y
Item # Est |Unit Price Extended Unit Price Extended Unit Price Extended Unit Price| Extended | Unit Price Extended
DESCRIPTION Qty Total Total Total Total Total
DRUM UNIT FOR BROTHER 8220 FAX
1 DR510 MACHINE 1 (% $ $114.55 $114.55] $129.60 $129.60] $127.90 $127.90 $115.12 $115.12
BROTHER BLACK TONER CARTRIDGE
FOR DCP-8060, DCP-8065DN, HL-5240,
HL-5250DN, HL-5250DNT, HL-5280DW,
MFC-8460N, MFC-8860DN, MFC-
2 TN550 8870DW, 3,500 PAGE YIELD 2 1% $ $53.00 $106.00 $55.30 $110.60 $51.36 $102.70 $44.94 $89.88
TOTAL No Bid $220.55 $240.20 $230.60 $205.00
CANON
CANON PGI-36 INK TANK — BLACK
FOR PIXMA 1p100 PORTABLE INKJET
3] 1509B002 [PHOTO PRINTER 24 |$ $ $12.99 $311.76 $12.00 $288.00 $17.95 $430.80 $11.24 $269.76
CANON CLI-36 INK TANK
—MULTICOLOR FOR PIXMA Ip100
4| 1511B002 [PORTABLE INKJET PHOTO RINTER 24 |$ $ $16.00 $384.00 $14.80 $355.20 $18.95 $454.80 $14.24 $341.76
TOTAL No Bid $695.76 $643.20 $885.60 $611.52
DELL
DELL TONER CARTRIDGE FOR DELL
3115cn COLOR LASER PRINTER-
5| 310-8395 |BLACK 8,000 PAGE YIELD 3 % $ $ $116.80 $350.40] $121.95 $365.85 $91.49 $274.47
DELL TONER CARTRIDGE FOR DELL
3115cn COLOR LASER PRINTER-
6| 310-8397 |CYAN 8,000 PAGE YIELD 3 % $ $ $216.20 $648.60] $229.85 $689.55 $169.49 $508.47
DELL TONER CARTRIDGE FOR DELL
3115cn COLOR LASER PRINTER-
7] 310-8399 |MAGENTA 8,000 PAGE YIELD 3 S S S $216.20 $648.60| $229.85 $689.55| $169.49 $508.47




CVR Computer Supplies

R& H Photo Video

The Tree House, Inc.

NHS Enterprises, LLC

Staples

00

310-8401

DELL TONER CARTRIDGE FOR DELL
3115cn COLOR LASER PRINTER-
YELLOW 8,000 PAGE YIELD

$216.20

$648.60

$229.85 $689.55

$169.49

$508.47

O

310-8707

DELL TONER CARTRIDGE FOR DELL
1720/1720DN PRINTER -BLACK 6,000
PAGE YIELD

$95.70

$287.10

$106.85 $320.55

$57.99

$173.97

TOTAL

No Bid

No Bid

$2,583.30

$2,755.05

$1,973.85

EPSON

10

T0601

EPSON STYLUS DURABRITE INK
CARTRIDGE FOR C88, 88/CX3800,
3810, 4200, 4800, 5800F, 7800 FOR
STYLUS INKJET PRINTER-BLACK 400
PAGE YIELD

$14.55

$43.65

$16.35 $49.05

$15.74

$47.22

11

T0602

EPSON STYLUS DURABRITE INK
CARTRIDGE FOR C88, 88/CX3800,
3810, 4200, 4800, 5800F, 7800 FOR
STYLUS INKJET PRINTER-CYAN 600
PAGE YIELD

$9.55

$28.65

$11.95 $35.85

$11.54

$34.62

12

T0603

EPSON STYLUS DURABRITE INK
CARTRIDGE FOR C88, 88/CX3800,
3810, 4200, 4800, 5800F, 7800 FOR
STYLUS INKJET PRINTER-MAGENTA
600 PAGE YIELD

$9.55

$28.65

$11.95 $35.85

$11.54

$34.62

13

T0604

EPSON STYLUS INK DURABRITE
CARTRIDGE FOR C88, 88/CX3800,
3810, 4200, 4800, 5800F, 7800 FOR
STYLUS INKJET PRINTER-YELLOW
600 PAGE YIELD

$9.55

$28.65

$11.95 $35.85

$11.54

$34.62

TOTAL

No Bid

No Bid

$129.60

$156.60

$151.08

HEWLET PACKAR

D

14

CB435A

HP BLACK LASERJET TONER
CARTRIDGE FOR P1005,1006
PRINTER

51

$45.00

$2,295.00

$56.50

$2,881.50

$49.90

$2,544.90

$57.90[ $2,952.90

$53.25

$2,715.75

15

CB436A

HP BLACK LASERJET TONER
CARTRIDGE FOR P1505, P1505N
PRINTER

26

$57.00

$1,482.00

$65.00

$1,690.00

$58.15

$1,511.90

$66.90[ $1,739.40

$61.77

$1,606.02

16

CB540A

HP BLACK LASER TONER
CARTRIDGE FOR CM1312NFl,
CP1515N, CP1518NI, CP1215 PRINTER

50

$56.00

$2,800.00

$66.00

$3,300.00

$58.20

$2,910.00

$66.90[ $3,345.00

$142.80

$7,140.00

17

CB541A

HP CYAN LASER TONER CARTRIDGE
FOR CM1312NFI, CP1515N, CP1518N,
CP1215 PRINTER

50

$53.00

$2,650.00

$59.95

$2,997.50

$55.00

$2,750.00

$60.90

$3,045.00

$63.20

$3,160.00




CVR Computer Supplies

R& H Photo Video

The Tree House, Inc.

NHS Enterprises, LLC

Staples

18

CB542A

HP YELLOW LASER TONER
CARTRIDGE FOR CM1312NFl,
CP1515N, CP1518NI, CP1215 PRINTER

50

$53.00

$2,650.00

$59.95

$2,997.50

$55.00

$2,750.00

$60.90

$3,045.00

$63.20

$3,160.00

19

CB543A

HP MAGENTA LASER TONER
CARTRIDGE FOR CM1312NFl,
CP1515N, CP1518NI, CP1215 PRINTER

50

$53.00

$2,650.00

$66.95

$3,347.50

$55.00

$2,750.00

$60.90

$3,045.00

$63.20

$3,160.00

20

CC364A

HP BLACK STANDARD YIELD LASER
TONER CARTRIDE FOR P4014, 4015,
P4515 PRINTER

$130.00

$260.00

$139.00

$278.00

$132.85

$265.70

$143.80

$287.60

$142.80

$285.60

21

CC530A

HP BLACK LASER TONER
CARTRIDGE FOR COLOR LASERJET
CP2025N PRINTER

$84.00

$672.00

$100.00

$800.00

$93.00

$744.00

$103.90

$831.20

$77.05

$616.40

22

CC531A

HP CYAN LASER TONER CARTRIDGE
FOR COLOR LASERJET CP2025N
PRINTER

$84.00

$672.00

$99.00

$792.00

$93.75

$750.00

$101.90

$815.20

$106.05

$848.40

23

CC532A

HP YELLOW LASER TONER
CARTRIDGE FOR COLOR LASERJET
CP2025N PRINTER

$84.00

$672.00

$109.99

$879.92

$93.75

$750.00

$101.90

$815.20

$106.05

$848.40

24

CC533A

HP MAGENTA LASER TONER
CARTRIDGE FOR COLOR LASERJET
CP2025N PRINTER

$84.00

$672.00

$99.00

$792.00

$93.75

$750.00

$101.90

$815.20

$106.05

$848.40

25

CD971AN

HP 920 BLACK INK CARTRIDGE FOR
OFFICEJET 6500A e-All-in-One
PRINTER E710a

$24.00

$48.00

$17.23

$34.46

$15.80

$31.60

$16.85

$33.70

$15.51

$31.02

26

CE285A

HP LASERJET 85A BLACK TONER
CARTRIDGE FOR 1100 SERIES,
LASERJET PRO P1102W , 1200
SERIES, M1212nf, PRINTER

$55.00

$330.00

$58.50

$351.00

$52.80

$316.80

$58.90

$353.40

$59.77

$358.62

27

CH634AN

HP 920 CYAN INK CARTRIDGE FOR
OFFICEJET 6500A e-All-in-One
PRINTER E710a

$14.00

$28.00

$9.00

$18.00

$7.55

$15.10

$7.75

$15.50

$7.96

$15.92

28

CH635AN

HP 920 MAGENTA INK CARTRIDGE
FOR OFFICEJET 6500A e-All-in-One
PRINTER E710a

$14.00

$28.00

$8.95

$17.90

$7.55

$15.10

$7.75

$15.50

$7.96

$15.92

29

CH636AN

HP 920 YELLOW INK CARTRIDGE FOR
OFFICEJET 6500A e-All-in-One
PRINTER E710a

$14.00

$28.00

$9.49

$18.98

$7.55

$15.10

$7.75

$15.50

$7.96

$15.92

30

C8765WN

HP #94 BLACK INJET CARTRIDGE
FOR DESKJET 5740 — 450 PAGE
YIELD

$26.00

$52.00

$21.49

$42.98

$18.15

$36.30

$19.02

$38.04

$18.06

$36.12

31

C8766WN

HP #95 TRI-COLOR INKJET
CARTRIDGE FOR DESKJET 5740 — 260
PAGE YIELD

$30.00

$60.00

$22.95

$45.90

$21.10

$42.20

$21.85

$43.70

$40.94

$81.88




CVR Computer Supplies

R& H Photo Video

The Tree House, Inc.

NHS Enterprises, LLC

Staples

32

Q2612A

HP BLACK TONER CARTRIDE FOR
LASERJET 1012, 1018, 3015, 3020,
3030, 3055

54

$50.00

$2,700.00

$64.95

$3,507.30

$58.10

$3,137.40

$66.40

$3,585.60

$45.54

$2,459.16

33

Q3960A

HP TONER CARTRIDE FOR 2550
SERIES COLOR LASERJET PRINTER -
BLACK, 5,000 PAGE YIELD

$70.00

$280.00

$75.96

$303.84

$70.85

$283.40

$77.90

$311.60

$80.15

$320.60

34

Q3961A

HP TONER CARTRIDGE FOR 2550
SERIES COLOR LASERJET PRINTER -
CYAN, 4,000 PAGE YIELD

$90.00

$270.00

$90.81

$272.43

$85.45

$256.35

$95.45

$286.35

$96.69

$290.07

35

Q3962A

HP TONER CARTRIDGE FOR 2550
SERIES COLOR LASERJET PRINTER -
YELLOW, 4,000 PAGE YIELD

$90.00

$270.00

$93.95

$281.85

$85.45

$256.35

$95.45

$286.35

$96.69

$290.07

36

Q3963A

HP TONER CARTRIDGE FOR 2550
SERIES COLOR LASERJET PRINTER -
MAGENTA, 4,000 PAGE YIELD

$90.00

$270.00

$98.00

$294.00

$85.45

$256.35

$95.45

$286.35

$96.69

$290.07

37

Q3964A

HP DRUM UNIT FOR 2550 SERIES
COLOR LASERJET PRINTER, 20,000
PAGE YIELD

$80.00

$240.00

$155.78

$467.34

$153.50

$460.50

$157.85

$473.55

$159.87

$479.61

38

Q5949X

HP BLACK SMART TONER CARTRIDE
FOR LASERJET 1320, - 6,0000 PAGE
YIELD

$60.00

$240.00

$141.95

$567.80

$129.20

$516.80

$138.90

$555.60

$263.78

$1,055.12

39

Q6000A

HP BLACK TONER CARTRIDGE FOR
LASERJET 1600, 2600 - 5K PG

30

$57.00

$1,710.00

$§72.19

$2,165.70

$61.00

$1,830.00

$69.80

$2,094.00

$131.81

$3,954.30

40

Q6001A

HP CYAN TONER CARTRIDGE FOR
LASERJET 2600 - 2K PG

27

$62.00

$1,674.00

$76.20

$2,057.40

$70.10

$1,892.70

$77.65

$2,096.55

$80.15

$2,164.05

41

Q6002A

HP YELLOW TONER CARTRIDGE FOR
LASERJET 2600 - 2K PG

27

$64.00

$1,728.00

$77.95

$2,104.65

$70.10

$1,892.70

$77.65

$2,096.55

$80.15

$2,164.05

42

Q6003A

HP MAGENTA TONER CARTRIDGE
FOR LASERJET 2600 - 2K PG

27

$68.00

$1,836.00

$76.20

$2,057.40

$70.10

$1,892.70

$77.65

$2,096.55

$80.15

$2,164.05

43

Q6470A

HP TONER CARTRIDE FOR COLOR
LASERJET 3600/3800 PRINTER BLACK

29

$90.00

$2,610.00

$119.95

$3,478.55

$109.40

$3,172.60

$122.80

$3,561.20

$128.46

$3,725.34

44

Q6471A

HP TONER CARTRIDE FOR COLOR
LASERJET 3600 PRINTER -CYAN

$115.00

$345.00

$118.95

$356.85

$113.20

$339.60

$121.90

$365.70

$128.03

$384.09

45

Q6472A

HP TONER CARTRIDE FOR COLOR
LASERJET 3600 PRINTER-YELLOW

$115.00

$345.00

$118.95

$356.85

$113.20

$339.60

$121.90

$365.70

$128.03

$384.09

46

Q6473A

HP TONER CARTRIDE FOR COLOR
LASERJET 3600 PRINTER-MAGENTA

$115.00

$345.00

$119.00

$357.00

$113.20

$339.60

$121.90

$365.70

$128.03

$384.09

47

Q7551A

HP BLACK STANDARD YIELD TONER
CARTRIDGE FOR P3005

$110.00

$440.00

$117.95

$471.80

$111.25

$445.00

$119.80

$479.20

$120.86

$483.44




CVR Computer Supplies R& H Photo Video The Tree House, Inc. NHS Enterprises, LLC Staples
HP TONER CARTRIDE FOR LASERJET
48| Q7553A |M2727-7000 PAGE YIELD 71 $63.00] $4,473.00] $74.42| $5,283.82] $69.05| $4,902.55| $75.40| $5,353.40| $75.00] $5,325.00
HP BLACK HIGH YIELD TONER
CARTRIDGE FOR P2012 LASERJET
49| Q7553X |PRINTER SERIES-3000 PAGEYIELD [ 8 | $149.00( $1,192.00| $132.84| $1,062.72| $126.00] $1,008.00| $136.90| $1,095.20| $258.39| $2,067.12
HP TONER CARTRIDGE FOR
50| Q7581A |LASERJET 3800 PRINTER - CYAN 24 | $100.00] $2,400.00| $149.95| $3,598.80| $146.00| $3,504.00| $154.80| $3,715.20| $165.22| $3,965.28
HP TONER CARTRIDGE FOR
51| Q7582A |LASERJET 3800 PRINTER - YELLOW [ 24 | $130.00| $3,120.00| $149.95| $3,598.80| $146.00| $3,504.00| $154.80| $3,715.20| $165.22| $3,965.28
HP TONER CARTRIDGE FOR
52| Q7583A |WASERJIET 3800 PRINTER-MAGENTA| 54 | ¢120.00] $2,880.00| $156.99| $3,767.76| $146.00| $3,504.00| $154.80| $3,715.20| $173.60| $4,166.40
TOTAL $47,417.00 $57,697.80 $52,682.90 $58,152.79 $65,425.65
TROY MICR
TROY 4250/4350 MICR TONER
02-81135- |SECURE CARTRIDGE-12,000 PAGE
53 001 YIELD 3 s $ $ $ $ $275.90 $827.70 $ S
TOTAL No Bid No Bid No Bid $827.70 No Bid

Note: Non-responsive-Ultra Laser Imaging submitted bid for remanufactured toners.




