PRIMARY AWARDED VENDOR
SECONDARY AWARDED VENDOR

City of Miami Gardens
1515 N.W. 167TH STREET
Miami Gardens, FL 33169

February 16, 2012 @ 2:00PM
ITB# 11-12-014 POLICE SAFETY SUPPLIES
TABULATION SHEET

Henry Schein, Inc Sirchie Finger Print Lab, Inc. Dana Safety Supply DGG Taser, Inc. Safety Zone Specialist, Inc.
PRIMARY AWARD SECONDARY AWARD
Irmo, SC Youngsville, NC Miami, FL Jacksonville, FL Lakeland, FL
Description Model Qty |Unit [Unit Prices |Ext. Total Unit Prices Ext. Total Unit Prices Ext. Total Unit Prices  |Ext. Total Unit Prices  |Ext. Total
Group A No Bid No Bid
Narcotic Test Kits Cocaine, HCI and
Crack Test (10 pack per box)
“Or Approved Equal” 0ODV7613 100(Bx S S $9.75 $975.00 $14.78 $1,478.00 $18.16 $1,816.00 |$ S
MF/Model/Pkg: Sirchie/10013/10PK Sirchie/NARK2007/10PK Forensic Source/Test G
Narcotic Test Kits Cannabis,
Duguenois Reagent (10 pack per
box) “Or Approved Equal” 0ODV7608 100|Bx |$ $ $9.75 $975.00 $9.67 $967.00 $18.16 $1,816.00 [$ $
MF/Model/Pkg: Sirchie/10008/10PK Sirchie/NARK10008/10PK Forensic Source/Test E
Evidence Bags — Printed Paper 5 1/2
X31/8X911/16 (100CT)
“Or Approved Equal” LG3-0021 10|Budl |S S $14.50 $145.00 $14.59 $145.90 $13.90 $139.00 |S$ S
MF/Model/Pkg: Sirchie/EBOOP/100CT Sirchie/EBOOOP/100CT Forensic Source/3-0021
Evidence Bags — Printed Paper 12 x
7 x 17 (100CT) “Or Approved Equal” | LG3-0024 10(Bud! |$ S $21.20 $212.00 $22.69 $226.90 $27.75 $277.50 |$ S
MF/Model/Pkg: Sirchie/EBO03P/100CT Sirchie/EBO03P/100CT Forensic Source/3-0024




Heavy Duty Plastic Evidence Bags
9X12 (100CT) “Or Approved Equal” 3-0912 20|pks | S $17.00 $340.00 $15.83 $633.20 $20.00 $400.00 S
MF/Model/Pkg: Sirchie/ZTE02/100CT Sirchie/EPP04/X40pck Forensic Source/3-0912
Nylon Evidence Tie Downs 8” X 4”
Flex Tabs - (100 CT) “Or Approved
Equal” NT-2 10|pks |S S $10.80 $108.00 $14.03 $140.30 $10.90 $109.00 S
MF/Model/Pkg: Sirchie/ET100/100 Sirchie/ET100/100 Forensic Source/NT-2
Impulse Property Bag Sealer
“Or Approved Equal” 3-0150 2|ea  |$ $ $180.00 $360.00 $163.48 $326.96 $151.10 $302.20 $
MF/Model/Pkg: Sirchie/696E Sirchie/696E Forensic Source/3-0150
Red/ Black “Sealed Evidence” Labels
(250 CT) “Or Approved Equal” Mar-00 20]rolls |S S $8.15 $163.00 $6.97 $139.40 $7.35 $147.00 S
MF/Model/Pkg: Sirchie/EIL11R/250CT Sirchie/EIL11R/250CT Forensic Source/3-4200
Tamper Guard Evidence Tape
“Or Approved Equal” BD2100-2 160]|rolls |$ $ $13.25 | $2,120.00 $11.78 $1,884.80 $13.65 $2,184.00 $
Sirchie/SM10002 Sirchie/SM5000SER Forensic Source/BD2100
TOTAL GROUP A $5,398.00 $5,942.46 $7,190.70 S
GROUP B No Bid No Bid none responsive No Bid
Disposable Restraints, Single Cuff
White MD4101 160(ea S S S S S $ $9.15 $1,464.00 S
Disposable Restraints, Double Cuff
White MD4200 150(ea S S S S S $ $14.17 $2,125.50 S
Changed
18" Autolock Tactical Batons 9170 25|ea S S S S S Specifications $85.00 $2,125.00 S
Changed
22" Autolock Tactical Batons 9130 25|ea S S S S Specifications $87.55 $2,188.75 S
TOTAL GROUP B $ $ $7,903.25 $
NO AWARD
GROUP C None responsive No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Binoculars 10 X 50 648 10|ea S S S S S S S $ $
Cougar Night Vision Binoculars (32-
40 Ip/mm ATN Gen-2 1lea |[$ $ $ $ $
Life Pack CPR Defibrillator A804030002 152|ea S S $ $ $




Handcuffs Hiatt, Standard size,

Chain, nickel Steel 100z. H2010 180[ea S S S S $ S
HOBBLE Restraints H100S 160]|ea S S S S S
TOTAL GROUP C *Didn't bid on all items
Henry Schein, Inc irchie Finger Print Lab, In Dana Safety Supply DGG Taser, Inc. Safety Zone Specialist, Inc

GROUP D (by items) No Bid

Yellow, Hi-Vis, 2.5 mil., Barrier

Tape “Police Line Don’t Cross”

“Or Approved Equal” SLY-PL 160|rolls No Bid $11.60 $1,856.00 $10.32 $1,651.20 S $10.60 $1,696.00
MF/Model/Pkg: Sirchie/BT200

Tactical Hand Held Metal Detector

“Or Approved Equal” 1165900 5|ea No Bid $179.00 $895.00 $108.68 $543.40 $ $ No Bid
MF/Model/Pkg: Henry Schein, Inc Sirchie Finger Print Lab, Inc. Dana Safety Supply DGG Taser, Inc. Safety Zone Specialist, Inc.

Top Loader Balances, Scale

Super Hybrid Sensor (6100g)

“Or Approved Equal” GF6000 1|ea No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
MF/Model/Pkg:

Disposable Hi-Vis Emergency

Blankets

“Or Approved Equal” EB5480 200(ea $3.78 $756.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
MF/Model/Pkg: Med Source/1320

Vionex hand wash

“Or Approved Equal” MX-1624 100|btls $2.87 $287.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
MF/Model/Pkg:

Diamond Grip Latex Gloves

Available Size (S-XL)

“Or Approved Equal” MF300L 500|Bx $10.04 $5,020.00 No Bid No Bid $8.05 $4,025.00
MF/Model/Pkg: Microflex/D.Gap PIP/62-32PF

36" High Impact Traffic Cones

“Or Approved Equal” TC36 50|ea No Bid No Bid No Bid $16.10 $805.00
MF/Model/Pkg: JBC/RS90055CT

28" High Impact Traffic Cone 4” &

6” Reflective Stripes

“Or Approved Equal” TC28-6-4 30|ea No Bid No Bid No Bid $15.20 $456.00




MF/Model/Pkg: JBC/RS70032CT3M64
Safety approved flashlight 8-1/8”
uses Battery Size D
“Or Approved Equal” 2117 50|ea No Bid No Bid $10.00 $500.00 $6.15 $307.50
MF/Model/Pkg: Brightstar/2117 RAYOVAC/IN2-MS
Flashlight Wand, Snap-In, Red, 6” L
“Or Approved Equal” 23853 50|ea No Bid No Bid $5.00 $250.00 $2.25 $112.50
MF/Model/Pkg: Brightstar/23853 RAYOVAC/INSB
5IN 1 E.M.S. Lifesaver Hammer
“Or Approved Equal” 10413 24|ea No Bid No Bid $10.80 $259.20 No Bid
MF/Model/Pkg: EMI/7001
Spur Il Pediatric Resuscitator 530212000 24|ea $11.89 $285.36 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Spur Il Adult Resuscitator 52021100 24|ea $9.11 $218.64 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Nickel Plated Brass Whistles
Pack of one dozen
NPW1 2|Dz No Bid No Bid $1.92 $46.08 No Bid
Nickel Plated Snake Chains Button
for Whistles NSC1 2|Dz No Bid No Bid $1.92 $46.08 No Bid
Road Warrior 2-Tone Traffic
Performance Mesh Vest. ANSI 107
Class 2 lime with orange trim and
“POLICE’ screen print on back
“Or Approved Equal” 30128 50|ea No Bid No Bid $9.93 $496.50 $15.75 $787.50
Carolina Safety/LHV-5ANSI PIP 302-MV
GROUP E (Fitting Required) NO AWARD No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Tactical Riot Helmet TR2001 20|ea
DT1740SM
Survivair Opti-fit CBRN Riot Control |DT1741 Med
Gas Mask DT1741lg 20|ea no bid

TOTAL GROUP E

none responsive

Corections: Dana Safety changed specifiactions on 18" and 22" Tactical Batons







