




DESCRIPTION
Est. 
Qty.

Unit 
Price

Extended 
Price Unit Price

Extended 
Price Unit Price

Extended 
Price

Unit 
Price

Extended 
Price

BASKETBALL
1 Reversible NBA Replica 

Jersey Youth Male sizes: S-
XL, Russell Athletic or 
“approved equal”. 300 $19.99 $5,997.00 $22.95 $6,885.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Brand/Model Offered

ADK Sports Inc. of 
Miami Gardens, FL

Matty's Sports Inc. of 
Miami, FL

Braverman Inc of Miami 
Gardens, FL

Unicommerce of 
Medley, FL

Russel Athletic

This is only a tabulation of prices submitted and is not an indication of award or responsiveness.

Russel Athletic

December 22, 2010
ITB # 10-11-010 Youth Sports Uniforms

City of Miami Gardens

2 Reversible NBA Replica 
Jersey, Adult Male sizes S-
3XL, Russell Athletic or 
“approved equal”. 100 $21.00 $2,100.00 $24.95 $2,495.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Brand/Model Offered

3 Mesh Shorts, Youth Male 
NBA Replica matching shorts, 
Youth Sizes:  S-XL Russell 
Athletic or “approved equal”.

300 $11.00 $3,300.00 $14.95 $4,485.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brand/Model Offered

4 Mesh Short, Adult Male, NBA 
Replica matching shorts, Adult 
Size:  S-3XL, Russell Athletic or 
“approved equal”.

100 $12.00 $1,200.00 $15.95 $1,595.00 No Bid No Bid
Brand/Model Offered

Total Baskeball Uniforms
$12,597.00 $15,460.00 No Bid No Bid

BASEBALL UNIFORMS

Russel Athletic

Russel Athletic

Russel Athletic

Russel Athletic

Russel Athletic Russel Athletic
Not Listed



5 Baseball Replica Jersey, 
Youth Male, Sizes: S-L. 
Majestic or “approved equal”.

300 $15.50 $4,650.00 $15.65 $4,695.00 $16.75 $5,025.00 No Bid No Bid
Brand/Model Offered

6 Baseball Replica Jersey, 
Adult Male, Sizes: S-2XL 
Majestic or “approved equal”.

100 $17.00 $1,700.00 $16.55 $1,655.00 $17.95 $1,795.00 No Bid No Bid
Brand/Model Offered

7 Baseball Pants, Youth Male, 
Sizes: XS-XL Alleson Athletic or 
“approved equal”.

300 $10.99 $3,297.00 $10.19 $3,057.00 $16.95 $5,085.00 No Bid No Bid
Brand/Model Offered

8 Baseball Pants, Adult Male, 
Sizes: S-2XL Alleson Athletic or 
“approved equal”.

100 $12.99 $1,299.00 $12.45 $1,245.00 $18.75 $1,875.00 No Bid No Bid
Brand/Model Offered

9 Socks, Youth Sizes: 6-8 ½. 
Manufacturer: AllSports or 
“approved equal”. 300 $4.00 $1,200.00 $2.35 $705.00 $3.50 $1,050.00 No Bid No Bid

B d/M d l Off d

Majestic Majestic Not Listed

Majestic Majestic Not Listed

Alleson Athletic Champro Not Listed

Alleson Athletic Champro Not Listed

Brand/Model Offered
All Sports All Sports

10 Socks, Varsity Two-In One
Sizes: Varsity 8 ½ -11.
Manufacturer: AllSports or
“approved equal”. 100 $4.75 $475.00 $2.49 $249.00 $3.65 $365.00 No Bid No Bid

Brand/Model Offered
All Sports

11
Caps, Major League Replica,  
One size fits all Outdoor Cap 
Company or “approved equal" 400 $7.50 $3,000.00 $4.99 $1,996.00 $5.75 $2,300.00 No Bid No Bid

Brand/Model Offered

TOTAL BASEBALL 
UNIFORMS $15,621.00 $13,602.00 $17,495.00 No Bid

SOCCER UNIFOMS

SOYAD Athletic

All Sports SOYAD Athletic

Not Listed Outdoor Not Listed



12 Soccer Uniforms Youth
and Adults, Male and
Female Youth sizes S-XL
and Adults sizes: S-XL.
Manufacturer: Score, Style
Costa Rica or “approved
equal”. 400 $31.65 $12,660.00 $16.20 $6,480.00 $15.95 $6,380.00 No Bid No Bid

Brand/Model Offered

TOTAL SOCCER 
UNIFORMS $12,660.00 $6,480.00 $6,380.00 No Bid No Bid

TRACK AND FIELD 
UNIFORMS

13 Speed Suit, Youth Male, 
Youth sizes: YS, YM, YL. 
Manufacturer: GameGear, 
Style: NS300PY or “approved 
equal”. 300 $25.50 $7,650.00 $18.82 $5,646.00 $14.10 $4,230.00 No Bid No Bid

Brand/Model Offered Game Gear Game Gear
14 Speed Suit, Adults Male, 

Adults sizes: XS, SM, MD, LG, 
XL, 2XL, 3XL, Manfacturer: 
GameGear, Style: NS300P or 
“approved equal”.

Costa Rica High 5 Stadium Protime Sports

Not Listed

100 $25.50 $2,550.00 $20.12 $2,012.00 $16.05 $1,605.00 No Bid No Bid
Brand/Model Offered

Game Gear
15 Racer Back Compression 

Top, Youth Female, Youth 
sizes: YS, YM, YL. 
Manufacturer: GameGear, 
Style: NS533Y or “approved 
equal”. 300 $19.50 $5,850.00 $15.10 $4,530.00 $10.95 $3,285.00 No Bid No Bid

Brand/Model Offered
Game Gear

16 Racer Back Compression 
Top, Adults Female, Adult 
sizes: SM, MD, LG, XL, 2XL, 
3XL. Manufacturer: GameGear, 
Style: NS533 or “approved 
equal”. 100 $20.50 $2,050.00 $16.05 $1,605.00 $11.75 $1,175.00 No Bid No Bid

Brand/Model Offered
Game Gear

Game Gear Not Listed

Game Gear Not Listed

Game Gear Not Listed



17
Compression Shorts, Youth 
Female, Youth sizes:  YS, YM, 
YL. Manufacturer: Game Gear, 
Style: NL111PY or “approved 
equal”. 300 $13.50 $4,050.00 $12.78 $3,834.00 $7.93 $2,379.00 No Bid No Bid

Brand/Model Offered Game Gear
18 Compression Shorts, Youth 

Adults, Adults sizes:  SM, MD, 
LG, XL, 2XL, 3XL. 
Manufacturer: Game Gear, 
Style: NL111P or “approved 
equal”. 100 $17.00 $1,700.00 $14.41 $1,441.00 $9.79 $979.00 No Bid No Bid

Brand/Model Offered
Game Gear

TOTAL TRACK AND 
FIELD UNFORMS $36,510.00 $25,548.00 $20,033.00 No Bid

SWIMWEAR
19 Swim Jammers, Youth Male, 

Youth size: 20-28. Sun Moon & 
Stars Splice Jammer by 
Speedo, Style #8050244 or 
“approved equal”.

100 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Game Gear Not Listed

Game Gear Not Listed

100 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brand/Model Offered

20 Swimwear, Youth Female  
Youth sizes: 20-28, Learn to 
Swim Super Pro Black by 
Speedo, style # 819021 or 
“approved equal” 100 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Brand/Model Offered

TOTAL SWIMWEAR No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

GRAND TOTAL

% Discount if awarded 
all items

Pyramid School Products is non-responsive for failure to bid on all items within a Group




