AWARD SHEET

Title: FOOTBALL EQUIPMENT

Contract # 09-10-035

Term: Two (2) Years with City option to renew for Two (2) Years on year to year basis
Effective 3/18/10 through 3/17/12

User Departments
Parks & Recreation

Vendor Contact Information

Name: Riddell/All American
Address: 669 Sugar Lane
Elyria, OH 44035-6309

FID: 34-1688715

Phone: (440) 355-2125

Fax: (440) 366-0041

Contact: James Brady

Email: [brady@riddellsales.com

Name: Marty Gilman, Inc., d/b/a Gilman Gear

Address: 30 Gilman Road
Gilman, CT 06336-0097

FID: 06-0623419

Phone: (800) 243-0398

Fax: (860) 823-1859

Contact: Neil Gilman

Email: admin@gilmangear.com

Contract Administrator:
Ellie Varona, Buyer (305) 622-8000 #2491 or evarona@miamigardens-fl.gov

Riddell/All American
Items Awarded: #1-Shoulder Pad Wagon - $193 each

#3-Sideline Markers Set - $86 set
#6-Weighted Corner Pylons Set - $26.70 set
#9-Varsity Football Down Box/Chain Set - $252.90 set



Marty Gilman, Inc., d/b/a Gilman Gear
Items Awarded: #4 & #5 Goal Post Padding - $400 pair



City of Miami Gardens
ITB # 09-10-035 FOOTBALL EQUIPMENT
February 25, 2010

This is only a tabulation of prices submitted and is not an indication of award or responsiveness.

Riddell Marty Gilman S&S Worldwide
Elyria, OH Gilman, CT NO BID
Est. Extended Extended Extended
Qty. | Unit Price Price Unit Price Price Unit Price Price
1 |4-Wheel Shoulder Pad Wagon
Brand: Olympia Sports or “Approved
Equal” meeting specifications.
17 $193.00 $3,281.00(No Bid $0.00
Brand/Model Offered Riddell RFBSPR2
2 |Sideline Markers
Brand: Olympia Sports or “Approved
Equal” meeting specifications.
29 $168.00 $4,872.00(No Bid $0.00
Brand/Model Offered Riddell RFBHRCK
3  |Sideline Markers
Brand: Olympia Sports or “Approved
Equal” meeting specifications.
12 $86.00 $1,032.00 $385.00 $4,620.00 $0.00
Brand/Model Offered Riddell ASSYM Gilman SMII
4 [Goal Post Padding with Miami
Gardens print
Brand: Olympia Sports or “Approved
Equal” meeting specifications.
10 |No Bid $400.00 $4,000.00 $0.00
Brand/Model Offered Gilman GPP12 - Pair




Riddell Marty Gilman S&S Worldwide
Elyria, OH Gilman, CT NO BID
Est. Extended Extended Extended
Qty. | Unit Price Price Unit Price Price Unit Price Price
5 |Goal Post Padding with Mascot
name print
Brand: Olympia Sports or “Approved
Equal” meeting specifications.
10 [No Bid $400.00 $4,000.00 $0.00
Brand/Model Offered Gilman GPP12 - Pair
6 |Weighted Football Corner Pylons Set
of 4
Brand: Stackhouse or “Approved
Equal” meeting specifications. 12 $26.70 $320.40 $96.00 $1,152.00 $0.00
Brand/Model Offered Riddell RWAP GilmanWP4
7 |Stack Powerhouse 90” Football Sled-
5 Man
Brand: Stackhouse or “Approved
Faual” meeting snecifications > No Bid $2'800'00 $14'000'00 SOOO
Brand/Model Offered Gilman 405SVW/BOD
8 |One man Sled (Cone)
Brand: Pro-Down or “Approved
Equal” meeting specifications. 10 |No Bid $895.00 $8,950.00 $0.00
Brand/Model Offered Gilman 201SV
9 |Varsity Football Down Box/Chain Set
Brand: Pro-Down or “Approved
Equal” meeting specifications.
7 $252.90 $1,770.30 $625.00 $4,375.00 $0.00
Brand/Model Offered Riddell RSDMCC Gilman PRO3 FLIPI
10 [Fisher Football Field Accessory Cart
Style: FAC100 or “Approved Equal”
meeting specifications.
6 $298.00 $1,788.00 $925.00 $5,550.00 $0.00
Brand/Model Offered Riddell RFBEQCRT Gilman SCI
11 |Airlessco Spray & Stripe 3000 1 No Bid No Bid $0.00

Brand/Model Offered




Est. Extended Extended Extended
Qty. | Unit Price Price Unit Price Price Unit Price Price
12 |Polytough Athletic Field Stencils
Numbers 0-5 2 No Bid $450.00 $900.00 $0.00
Brand/Model Offered
13 |Polytough Athletic Field Stencils
“G” for Goal Line 2 No Bid $150.00 $300.00 $0.00
Brand/Model Offered
TOTAL $13,063.70 $47,847.00 $0.00




