
 

City of Miami Gardens 
1515 N.W. 167

th
 Street: Bldg. 5 Suite 200 

Miami Gardens, Florida 33169 

 

Procurement Department 

Tabulation Sheet 
ITB#08-09-029 CITY WIDE CATERING SERVICES 

April 30, 2009 @ 2:00 p.m. 

Description 
AWARDED VENDORS 

Classic 
Caterers 
954-590-2323 

Adams 
Catering 
305-685-5500 

Bleu Flame 
 
305-628-2446 

Angel’s 
Catering 
216-272-1613 

The Mahogany 
Grille 
305-626-8100 

 $per person $per person $per person $per person $per person 

#1 Typical Continental 
     Breakfast:  

     

3-15 guests $no bid $12.00 $9.25 $3.29 $6.00 

16-50 guests $5.95 $12.00 $8.50 $3.28 $9.00 

51-120 guests $5.75 $10.00 $8.25 $3.20 $18.00 

121-300 guests $5.25 $8.00 $7.50 $2.99 $23.00 

301+guests $4.95 $8.00 $6.95 $2.59 $28.00 
#2 Typical Hot Buffet    
     Breakfast: 

     

3-15 guests $no bid $12.00 $13.95 $4.99 $9.00 

16-50 guests $10.95 $12.00 $13.25 $4.79 $12.00 

51-120 guests $11.95 $10.00 $12.75 $4.59 $18.00 

121-300 guests $10.95 $10.00 $12.25 $4.39 $21.00 

301+guests $9.95 $10.00 $12.00 $4.19 $25.00 
#3 Typical Sandwich  
      Lunch: 

     

3-15 guests $no bid $14.00 $11.50 $3.99 $6.00 

16-50 guests $10.95 $12.00 $11.00 $3.89 $12.00 

51-120 guests $8.95 $12.00 $10.50 $3.69 $21.00 

121-300 guests $8.45 $10.00 $9.75 $3.59 $26.00 

301+guests $7.95 $10.00 $9.00 $3.29 $55.00 
#4 Typical Hot Buffet  
     Lunch: 

     

3-15 guests $no bid $14.00 $18.95 $7.99 $12.00 

16-50 guests $12.95 $14.00 $17.95 $7.79 $24.00 

51-120 guests $11.25 $12.00 $16.95 $7.59 $34.00 

-300 guests $9.95 $12.00 $15.25 $7.39 $38.00 
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301+guests $8.95 $10.00 $14.00 $6.99 $44.00 

Description Classic 
Caterers 

Adams 
Catering 

Bleu Flame 
 

Angel’s 
Catering 

The Mahogany 
Grille 

 $per person $per person $per person $per person $per person 
Option: One Entrée:      

3-15 guests $no bid $12.00 $16.50 $6.59 $9.00 

16-50 guests $11.95 $12.00 $15.50 $6.59 $18.00 

51-120 guests $10.95 $12.00 $14.25 $6.39 $24.00 

121-300 guests $8.95 $10.00 $13.95 $6.39 $33.00 

301+guests $8.25 $10.00 $12.25 $5.99 $38.00 
#5 Typical Hot Buffet 
     Dinner: 

     

3-15 guests $no bid $14.00 $19.45 $8.99 $28.00 

16-50 guests $15.95 $14.00 $18.25 $8.89 $34.00 

51-120 guests $14.95 $14.00 $17.25 $8.79 $40.00 

121-300 guests $13.95 $14.00 $16.00 $8.59 $46.00 

301+guests $11.95 $12.00 $13.95 $8.29 $52.00 
Option: One Entrée:      

3-15 guests $no bid $12.00 $16.95 $6.99 $23.00 

16-50 guests $14.95 $12.00 $16.25 $6.89 $27.00 

51-120 guests $13.95 $12.00 $15.50 $6.79 $34.00 

121-300 guests $12.95 $12.00 $14.85 $6.59 $41.00 

301+guests $10.95 $12.00 $12.95 $6.39 $47.00 
      

#6 BBQ Events:      
    Hamburgers:      

3-15 guests 

$non 
responsive 

$10.00 $9.25 $3.99 $8.50 

16-50 guests 

$non 
responsive 

$10.00 $8.95 $3.89 $10.50 

51-120 guests $11.70 $8.00 $7.50 $3.69 $13.50 

121-300 guests $11.35 $7.00 $7.00 $3.59 $15.00 

301+guests $10.50 $7.00 $6.25 $3.29 $16.50 

   Hot Dogs:      

3-15 guests $no bid $10.00 $4.25 $2.99 $2.00 

16-50 guests $8.95 $10.00 $3.95 $2.89 $4.00 

51-120 guests $7.95 $8.00 $3.25 $2.79 $6.00 

121-300 guests $6.95 $7.00 $2.95 $2.69 $8.00 



 

301+guests $6.25 $7.00 $2.45 $2.49 $10.00 

                 
 

 

 

 

Description Classic 
Caterers 

Adams 
Catering 

Bleu Flame 
 

Angel’s 
Catering 

The Mahogany 
Grille 

 Price Price Price Price Price 

#7 Platters:      
     Fresh Fruit Platter:      

Serves 10 guests $no bid $35.00 $27.95 $8.99 $12.00 
Serves 25 guests $25.00 $45.00 $50.00 $15.99 $14.50 
Serves 50 guests $45.00 $90.00 $102.50 $29.99 $25.00 

    Cheese Platter:      
Serves 10 guests $no bid $35.00 $31.25 $9.99 $12.00 
Serves 25 guests $35.95 $45.00 $60.00 $17.99 $14.00 
Serves 50 guests $54.95 $90.00 $110.95 $29.99 $25.00 

    Vegetable Platter:      
Serves 10 guests $no bid $35.00 $22.95 $4.99 $12.00 
Serves 25 guests $29.95 $45.00 $40.95 $8.99 $14.00 
Serves 50 guests $59.95 $90.00 $78.95 $19.99 $25.00 

   Turkey Platter:      
Serves 10 guests $9.95 $35.00 $28.95 $10.79 $18.00 
Serves 25 guests $8.95 $55.00 $62.95 $19.99 $21.00 
Serves 50 guests $7.95 $105.00 $105.95 $28.99 $32.00 

OPTIONS:      
1. Tables:      

4’X 30” rectangular $No Bid    /each $No Bid    /each $7.00    /each $8.00   /each $40.00  /each 

6’X 30” rectangular $No Bid    /each $5.00        /each $ 7.50   /each $9.00   /each $56.00  /each 

8’X 30” rectangular $No Bid    /each $7.00        /each $ 7.75   /each $10.00 /each $64.00  /each 

3’ round $No Bid    /each $No Bid    /each $ 6.75   /each $8.00   /each $40.00  /each 

4’ round $No Bid    /each $5.00        /each $7.00    /each $8.50   /each $56.00  /each 

5’ round $No Bid    /each $5.00        /each $7.50    /each $9.00   /each $64.00  /each 

6’ round $No Bid    /each $5.00        /each $8.50    /each $10.00 /each $80.00  /each 

30” cocktail $No Bid    /each $9.00        /each $6.75    /each $5.00   /each $56.00  /each 
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Description Classic 
Caterers 

Adams 
Catering 

Bleu Flame 
 

Angel’s 
Catering 

The Mahogany 
Grille 

 Price Price Price Price Price 

2. Table Linen 
(misc. colors): 

     

4’X 30” rectangular $No Bid    /each $5.00      /each $12.75  /each $10.50 /each $12.00    /each 

6’X 30” rectangular $No Bid    /each $5.00      /each $No Bid /each $10.50 /each $14.00    /each 

8’X 30” rectangular $No Bid    /each $5.00      /each $No Bid /each $10.50 /each $16.00    /each 

3’ round $No Bid    /each $5.00      /each $12.25  /each $10.50 /each $13.00    /each 

4’ round $No Bid    /each $5.00      /each $14.00  /each $10.50 /each $15.00    /each 

5’ round $No Bid    /each $5.00      /each $16.00  /each $10.50 /each $17.00   /each 

6’ round $No Bid    /each $7.00      /each $17.00  /each $10.50 /each $19.00  /each 

30” cocktail $No Bid    /each $7.00     /each $10.85  /each $10.50 /each $150.00 /each 
3. Chairs:      

             Folding Chairs $No Bid    /each $1.00     /each $2.50    /each $1.50   /each $8.00     /each 
             Stacking Chairs $No Bid    /each $1.00     /each $2.50    /each $2.50   /each $24.00    /each 

4. Set-up & 
Breakdown: 

$No Bid $150.00 $100.00 $75.00 $150.00 

5. Delivery & Pick-
up: 

$No bid $18.00 $50.00 $25.00 $100.00 

 

          This is only a tabulation of prices submitted and is not an indication of award or responsiveness. 
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