AWARD SHEET
Title: PURCHASE AND DELIVERY OF SPORTS EQUIPMENT
Contract: ITB # 12-13-030
Term: 2 years contract w/opt to renew for 1 additional year on a year to year basis
Effective 03/2/13 through 03/1/15

User Departments
Parks & Recreation

Vendor Contact Information

Name: BSN Sports

Address: PO Box 49
Jenkintown, PA 19046

FID: 22-2795073

Phone: (800) 445-9446

Fax: (800) 523-5112

Contact Person Bill Aburge

Email: baburge@bsnsports.com

Vendor # 002645

Vendor Contact Information

Name: American Soccer INC

Address: 726 E Anaheim Street
Wilmington, CA 90744

FID: 95-2984338

Phone: (800) 626-7774

Fax: (800) 426-1222

Contact Person Vicki Cairns

Email: vicki@scoresports.com

Vendor # 007115

Vendor Contact Information

Name: Riddell

Address: Sugar Lane
Elyria, OH 44035

FID: 65-0722026

Phone: (440) 355-2127

Fax: (440) 366-0041

Contact Person Paul J. Fabianich

Email: pjfabianich@riddellsales.com

Vendor # 004010


mailto:baburge@bsnsports.com
mailto:vicki@scoresports.com
mailto:pjfabianich@riddellsales.com

Vendor Contact Information

Name: S&S Worldwide

Address: 75 Mill Street
Colchester, CT 06415

FID: 06-0520020

Phone: (800) 642-7354

Fax: (800) 432-2842

Contact Person Carol Mares

Email: bids@ssww.com

Vendor Contact Information

Name: Pyramid School Products

Address: 6510 North 54" Street
Tampa, FL 33610

FID: 59-0932660

Phone: (800) 792-2644

Fax: (813) 621-7688

Contact Person Kenneth O. Miller

Email: bids@pyramidsp.com

Contract Administrator:
Elena Varona, Buyer phone: (305)-622-8000 ext 2491,
e-mail; evarona@miamigardens-fl.gov

Primary Vendors

American Soccer Co. Items: 40, 41, 42, 49

BSN Sports, Items: 3, 5, 9, 10, 13, 15-24, 28, 29, 30, 33, 35-39, 43-45, 48, 50, 52, 54
Pyramid School Products, Items: 1, 4, 6, 7, 31, 32, 47, 51, 53

Riddell, Items: 2, 11, 12, 14, 25, 26, 27

S&S Worldwide, Items: 8, 34, 46, 55

Secondary Vendors

American Soccer Co. Items: 9, 11, 12

BSN Sports, Items: 1, 4, 6, 7, 8, 14, 25, 26, 27, 31, 32, 34, 46, 49, 51, 53, 55
Pyramid School Products, Items: 2, 3, 5, 10, 15, 33, 37, 40-45, 48, 52
Riddell, Items: 23, 24, 28, 29, 47


mailto:bids@ssww.com
mailto:bids@pyramidsp.com
mailto:evarona@miamigardens-fl.gov

City of Miami Gardens
ITB # 12-13-019 Purchase and Delivery of Sports Equipment

January 24, 2013

This is only a tabulation of prices submitted and is not an indication of award or responsiveness.
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Item Est. Extended E: ded E: ded Extended Extended
# |DESCRIPTION Qty. | Unit |Unit Price | Price | Unit Price Price Unit Price |  Price Unit Price Price Unit Price Price
BASKETBALL
1 for indoor use, 28.5,
Spalding TF-1000 or "approved
| lequal" 20 Ea $41.50{ $830.00 $64.08 $1,281.60 $30.98 $619.60 $18.94|  $378.80 $39.81 $796.20
Brand/Style Offered: Spalding/TF1000 Riddell A/S #1336023 WILSON/WTB1255 Score #TX6000 As spec'd
#W9987
2 |Basketballs for indoor use, 29.5,
Spalding TF-1000 or "approved
| lequal" 20 Ea $41.50) $830.00 $28.00 $560.00 $30.98 $619.60 $18.94|  $378.80 $39.82 $796.40
Brand/Style Offered: Spalding/TF 1000 Riddell SUB#R42420 WILSON #WTB1254 Score #TX6000 As spec'd
#W9987
3 |Basketballs for outdoor use,
28.5, McGregor 6000 or
"approved equal® 20 | Ea $15.00] $300.00 §23.76 §475.20 $9.98]  $199.60 $14.94|  $298.80 $9.83]  $196.60
Brand/Style Offered: Spalding/TF250 Riddell A/S #MCX6285X  |Champion #SB1030 Score #SX3000 As spec'd
#W694002
4 |Basketballs for outdoor use,
29.5, McGregor 6000 or
"approved equal 20 Ea $15.00] $300.00 $23.76 $475.20 $9.98 $199.60 $14.94 $298.80 $10.13 $202.60
Brand/Style Offered: Spalding/TF250 Riddell A/S #MCX6000X  |Champion #SB1020 Score #SX3000 As spec'd
S&S Worldwide, Inc. Riddell Pyramid School  |Score American Soccer BSN Sports
Products Company
5 [Tabletop Score Boards for
indoor use, MacGregor or
"approved equal” 5 Ea $349.95| $1,749.75 $344.17|  $1,720.85
Brand/Style Offered: No bid No bid Champion #T90 No bid As spec'd
6 |LED Basketball Possession
Indicator with toggle switch, BSN
Spors or "approved equal 5 | Ea s0.00| $77.05| 38975 $80.32|  $446.60
Brand/Style Offered: No bid No bid Champion/Parrow No bid As spec'd
7 |Score Books- 30 games
20 Ea $5.80] $116.00 $6.00 $120.00 $2.62 52.40 $2.87 $57.40
Brand/Style Offered: AthSpec #W4489 Riddell #RASMARKV Champion/BBI No bid Macgregor #MSRSKBOK
8 [Ultmate Ball Locker- Heavy
duty 1" blue powder coated
steel tubing, can be padlocked,
holds up to 28 official size
basketballs, 45"Lx24'Wx38"H
with 4 wheels.
Manufacture/Style: BSN Sports
or “approved equal’. 5 Ea $147.00{ $735.00 $0.00f $289.95 $1,449.75 $232.21| $1,161.05
Brand/Style Ofiered: STS Siver #W5974 o bid Charmpion #MBLX No bid BSN #1162622
9 |Whistles black aerodynamic
design without plastic ball,
Manufacture/Style: Acme
Tornado 2000 or “approved
equal’. 50 Ea $4.00] $200.00 $3.94 $197.00 $2.61 $130.50
Brand/Style Offered: Fox 40 #W7385 No bid No bid Score #FOX40 PEPRL  |As spec'd
BASEBALL
10 |Tee Ball-Low bounce rubber
core, double stitthed seams.
Manufacture/Style: Macgregor
Official Tee Ball or “approved
equal’. 20 | Dz $20.16] $403.20 $22.49 $449.80[  $16.98]  339.60 $29.40|  $588.00 §16.89|  §337.80
Brand/Style Offered: STS#Wr119 Riddell #R42218 Chsampion/BSCI Score #CBB60 As spec'd




S&S Worldwide, Inc. Riddell Pyramid School Score American Soccer

Products Company BSN Sports

Baseball-Oficial Senior Litle
League Game play, must be
stamped RS, full grain leather
cover. Manufacture/Style:
Rawlings RSLL Sr. Litle League
or “approved equal’. 20 | Dz $27.39 $547.80 $0.00 $41.40|  $828.00 $47.78 $955.60

Brand/Style Ofered: No bid Riddell #42212 No Bid Score #CII50B As specd

)

Baseball- Litle League, Raised
Seems, Cork and Rubber
Center, Full Grain Leather
Cover. Manufacture/Style:
Rawlings RLLB-1 Litle League
or “approved equal’. 20 | Dz $34.95| $699.00 $27.39 $547.80 $0.00 $41.40|  $828.00 $47.78 $955.60

Brand/Style Oftered: Rawling #W8018 Riddell #42210 No Bid Score #ClI50B As spec'd

@

Baseball- NOCSAE Standard,
Leather cover with patented Tri-
Flex Safety Core.
Manufacture/Style: Macgregor
Safe/Soft Baseball or “approved
equal’. 20 | Dz $0.00 §32.53 $650.60

Brand/Style Oftered: No bid No bid No Bid No Bid Macgregor Level 5

=

Baseball- 13-18 year old play,
cushioned cork center, high
grade/white/gray windings, top
grain cowhide leather.
Manufacture/Style: Macgregor
#73 Plus Senior Litle League or

“approved equal’. 20 | Dz $27.39 $547.80 $0.00 $30.18]  $603.60

Brand/Style Ofeered: No bid Riddell #R42212 No Bid No Bid As spec'd

o

Baseball-Soft, Durable Yellow
polyurethane, designed for safe
aluminum bats.
Manufacture/Style: Macgregor
Dimpled Machine Balls or
“approved equal”. 20 | Dz 27.69 $553.80 $19.98)  $399.60 §14.68 $293.60

Brand/Style Oftered: No bid Riddell #RRSFDIMY Champion/DB10 No Bid As spec'd

S&S Worldwide, Inc. Riddell Pyramid School  [Score American Soccer

BSN
Products Company SN Sports

>

Baseball-Soft, Developed for
metal bat use, Softer than
standard polyurathane dimple
balls. Manufacture/Style:
Macgregor Soft Orange
Machine ball or “approved
equal’. 20 | Dz §14.69 $293.80

Brand/Style Oftered: No bid No Bid No Bid No Bid As spec'd

]

Baseball- Full Grain Leather Cover,
Super Strength Seams, Red
cushion cork Center.
Manufacture/Style: Atec Pitching
Machine Ball or “approved equal”. 20 Dz $44.96 $899.20

Brand/Style Offered: No bid No Bid No Bid No Bid As spec'd

£

Bats-7046 alloy- 2-1/4 Barrel,
thin handle with synthetic grip,
meets & stamped with .15 BPF,
Length: 28, 29, 30, 31, 32"
Manufacture/Style: Macgregor
X9 Youth Aluminum or
“approved equal'. 30 | Ea $22.82|  $684.60

Brand/Style Offered: No bid No Bid No Bid No Bid As spec'd

©

Bats-7046 alloy- 2-1/4 Barrel,
thin handle with synthetic grip,
meets & stamped with .15 BPF,
Length: "27, 29, 30, 31, 32"
Manufacture/Style: Macgregor
X88 Youth Aluminum or
“approved equal’. 30 | Ea $0.00 $13.72)  $411.60

Brand/Style Oftered: No bid No bid No Bid No Bid Macgregor #1300642

15y

Bats-7046 alloy- 2-1/4 Barrel,
thin handle with synthetic grip,
meets & stamped with .15 BPF,
Length: 27, 29, 30, 31, 32"
Manufacture/Style: Macgregor
X8Youth Aluminum or
“approved equal’. 30 | Ea $0.00 §13.72 $411.60

Brand/Style Oftered: No bid No bid No Bid No Bid As spec'd




S$&S Worldwide, Inc.

Riddell

Pyramid School
Products

Score American Soccer
Company

BSN Sports

2

Bats-7046 alloy- 2-1/4 Barrel,
thin handle with synthetic grip,
meets & stamped with .15 BPF,
Length: "25, 26 "
Manufacture/Style: Macgregor

Tee Ball or “approved equal’.

30

Ea

$13.72

$411.60

Brand/Style Offered:

No bid

No Bid

No Bid

As spec'd

2

N

Bats-7046 alloy- 2-1/4 Fast
Pitch Botfle Barrel, handle with
synthetic grip, ASA Certfied
Length: "27, 28, 29, 30, 31, 32,
33, 34 " Manufacture/Style:
Macgregor X6sb Fast pitch or
“approved equal’.

30

Ea

$19.97

$599.10

Brand/Style Offered:

No bid

No bid

No Bid

No Bid

As spec'd

2

@

Batting Helmets-Meets
NOCSAE standard, venting
system, foam liner for comfort
and protection, one size fits all,
pre-drilled and marked for wire
face mask. Manufacturer/Style:
Macgregor Youth Vented batfing
helmetor “approved equal”

100

Ea

$20.00| $2,000.00

$12.59 $1,259.00

$12.47

$1,247.00

Brand/Style Offered:

Kranos Navy #W3540

Riddell R42009

No Bid

No Bid

As spec'd/helmet no mask

24

Junior Set- Adjustable
Catcher's Helmet, junior chest
protector, junior double knee leg
guards. Color: Black.
Manufacture/Style: Macgregor
Junior Catcher's Gear Pack or
“approved equal”’

Sets

$55.37

$830.55

$0.00

$54.31

$814.65

Brand/Style Offered:

No bid

Riddell #R42115, R42175,

R42183

No Bid

No Bid

As spec'd

$&S Worldwide, Inc.

Riddell

Pyramid School
Products

Score American Soccer
Company

BSN Sports

2

a

Youth Set- Adjustable
Catcher's Helmet, Youth chest
protector, Youth double knee leg
guards. Color: Black.
Manufacture/Style: Macgregor
Youth Catcher's Gear Pack or
“approved equal’.

Sets

§100.00| $1,500.00

$50.78

$761.70

$0.00

$81.18

$1,217.70

Brand/Style Offered:

Easton #W10184

Riddell #R42115, R42171,

R42184

No Bid

No Bid

As spec'd

2

>

Prep Set- Pro Style Youth
Catcher's Helmet, Prep chest
protector, Prep double knee leg
guards. Color: Black.
Manufacture/Style: Macgregor
Prep Catcher's Gear Pack or
“approved equal’.

Sets

$102.00 $1,530.00

$82.67

$1,240.05

$0.00

$100.24

$1,503.60

Brand/Style Offered:

Intermediate Easton# W'

Riddell #R42150, R42166,

R42164

No Bid

No Bid

As spec'd

2

i

Varsity Set- Pro Style Varsity
Catcher's Helmet, Varsity chest
protector, Varsity double knee
leg guards. Color: Black.
Manufacture/Style: Macgregor
Varsity Catcher's Gear Pack or
“approved equal’.

Sets

$83.18

$1,247.70

$0.00

$106.97

$1,604.55

Brand/Style Offered:

No bid

Riddell #R42150,
R42164

R42166,

No Bid

No Bid

As spec'd

2

@

Junior Catcher's Mitt- full
grain leather, pre-oiled, deep
pocket scoop, for ages 5-8yrs.
Manufacture/Style: Macgregor
Junior Catcher's mitt or
“approved equal’.

Ea

$54.00

$540.00

$0.00

$29.78

$297.80

Brand/Style Offered:

No bid

Riddell #RRBSJC

CMR A/S

No Bid

No Bid

As spec'd




S&S Worldwide, Inc.

Riddell

Pyramid School
Products

Score

American Soccer
Company

BSN Sports

29

Youth Catcher's Mitt- full
grain leather, pre-oiled, deep
pocket scoop, for ages 9-12yrs.
Manufacture/Style: Macgregor
Junior Catcher's mitt or
“approved equal”

Ea

$54.00 $540.00

$0.00

$33.95

$339.50

Brand/Style Offered:

No bid

Riddell #BSY SCMX A/S

No Bid

No Bid

As spec'd

30

Prep Catcher's Mitt- full grain
leather, pre-oiled, deep pocket
scoop, for ages 12-15yrs.
Manufacture/Style: Macgregor
Junior Catcher's mitt or
“approved equal”.

Ea

$62.00 $620.00

$0.00

$34.95

$349.50

Brand/Style Offered:

No bid

Riddell #RRBS100X A/S

No Bid

No Bid

As spec'd

3

Pitching Machine-Pitching
speed 15 to 60mph, throws
grounders, flies, line drives, and
pop-ups, digital speed read out
To include 5 Year limited
warranty. Manufacture/Style:
Jugs Jr. Baseball Machine or
"approved equal"

Ea

$1,682.77 $8,413.85

§1,142.95 $5714.75

$1,339.75

$6,698.75

Brand/Style Offered:

No bid

Riddell #RRJRPMBB A/S JU

Jugs/M1400

No Bid

As spec'd

32

Pitching Machine-Pitching
speed 30 to 90mph, throws
grounders, flies, line drives, and
pop-ups, digital speed read out
To include 5 Year limited
warranty. Manufacture/Style:
Jugs 101 Baseball Piching
Machine or “approved equal’.

Ea

$2,544.33|  $12,721.65

$1,879.95[ $9,399.75

$2,084.05

$10,420.25

Brand/Style Offered:

No bid

Riddell #RRJ101BBPM

Jugs/M1010

No Bid

As spec'd

S&S Worldwide, Inc.

Riddell

Pyramid School
Products

Score

American Soccer
Company

BSN Sports

33

Batting Tee- Constructed of
Durable Rubber, Adjustable hitting
height from "20" to "40" 20 different
drill positions. To include 5 Year
limited warranty . Manufacture/Style:
Varsity 5 Position Batting Tee or
“approved equal”.

Ea

$183.69 §2,755.35

$47.95 $719.25

$42.97

$644.55

Brand/Style Offered:

No bid

Riddell #RRBSTTMT

Champion #BT50

No Bid

As spec'd

34

Batting Tee- Constructed of
Durable Rubber, Adjustable
hiting height from "20" o "40".
Manufacture/Style: Macgregor
Official Batting Tee or “approved
equal’.

Ea

$13.00] $195.00

$23.39 $350.85

$19.98]  $299.70

$15.17

§227.55

Brand/Style Offered:

Champion #W5771 22"

Riddell #RBSTEE

Champion #90

No Bid

As spec'd

35

Permanent Bat Rack-Heavy-
duty galvanized steel bat rack,
holds up to 14 bats, permanenty
mounts directy to dugout
surface, Size:
35"HX25.5"WX6"D, wt 33lbs.

Ea

$68.93

$689.30

Brand/Style Offered:

No bid

No bid

No Bid

No Bid

As spec'd

36

Line-up Card Booklet-
carbonless line-up cards, 24
sefs per booklet, 5 1/2 x 8 2
Manufacture/Style: Macgregor
Line-up Card Bookletor
“approved equal”.

50

Ea

$3.77

$188.50

Brand/Style Offered:

No bid

No bid

No Bid

No Bid

As spec'd

37

Baseball Scorebook- book
that scores 26 games with 18
bating positons, and 9 innings
sheets, pages 9-1/2 x 11"
Manufacture/Style: Macgregor
Official Scorebook or “approved
equal’.

50

Ea

$5.30] $265.00

$2.89|  $144.50

$6.94  $347.00

$2.77

$138.50

Brand/Style Offered:

Athletic Specialist
#W4488 25 games

Champion #SC1

Score #BB692

As spec'd




S&S Worldwide, Inc.

Riddell

Pyramid School
Products

Score American Soccer
Company

BSN Sports

38

Sports Hydration Tank with
Cart In accordance with
specifications.

Ea

$1,089.12

$5,445.60

No bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

As spec'd

39

Baseball Tote- strong 600
denier polyester, wil hold 15
bats with zipper, double
reinforced botiom with standard
shoulder straps, size:
39"Lx12"W. Manufacture/Style:
Macgregor Baseball Equipment
Tote or “approved equal’.

20

Ea

$15.69

$313.80

Brand/Style Offered:

No bid

No bid

No Bid

No Bid

As spec'd

Soccer

40

Soccer Balls- high gloss
cushioned urethane cover for
durability, size 3.
Manufacture/Style: Macgregor
World Class Soccer Ball or
“approved equal’.

Ea

$16.89

$168.90

$6.06 $60.60

$5.54 $55.40

$6.26

$62.60

Brand/Style Offered:

No bid

Riddell #1235562

AIS

Champion/STRIKER3

Score Galaxy #1460-3

As spec'd

41

Soccer Balls- high gloss
cushioned urethane cover for
durability, size 4.
Manufacture/Style: Macgregor
World Class Soccer Ball or
“approved equal”

Ea

$16.89

$168.90

$6.06 $60.60

$5.84 $58.40

$6.61

$66.10

Brand/Style Offered:

No bid

Riddell #1235579

AIS

Champion/STRIKER4

Score Galaxy #1460-4

As spec'd

42

Soccer Balls- high gloss
cushioned urethane cover for
durability, size 5.
Manufacture/Style: Macgregor
World Class Soccer Ball or
“approved equal’.

Ea

$16.89

$168.90

$6.06 $60.60

$6.04 $60.40

$6.86

$68.60

Brand/Style Offered:

No bid

Riddell #1235586

AIS

Champion/STRIKERS

Score Galaxy #1460-5

As spec'd

S&S Worldwide, Inc.

Riddell

Pyramid School
Products

Score American Soccer
Company

BSN Sports

43

Soccer Goal-Aluminum frame,
ground anchors, 3mm white nets
included, net clips included, builtin
net clip frack, 4'H x 6'W x 2Dx 4B
98Ibs. Manufacture/Style:
Alumagoal Aluminum Club goals or
“approved equal”.

Ea

$1,518.63

$3,037.26

$887.95| $1,775.90

$398.61

$797.22

Brand/Style Offered:

No bid

Riddell #1235255

AIS

Kwik Goal/l2B3001

No bid

As spec'd

44

Soccer Goal-Aluminum frame,
ground anchors, 3mm white nets
included, net clips included, built
in netclip track, 4.5'H x 9'Wx
2'D x 4'B 112lbs.
Manufacture/Style: Alumagoal
Aluminum Club goals or
“approved equal’.

Ea

$1,601.30

$3,202.60

$959.95| $1,919.90

$428.47

$856.94

Brand/Style Offered:

No bid

Riddell #1235246

AIS

Kwik Goal/2B3002

No bid

As spec'd

45

Soccer Goal-Aluminum frame,
ground anchors, 3mm white nets
included, net clips included, built
in netclip track, 6.5'H x 12'Wx
3'D x 6'B 157Ibs.
Manufacture/Style: Alumagoal
Aluminum Club goals or
“approved equal’.

Ea

$1,683.96

$3,367.92

$1,189.95| $2,379.90

$539.63

$1,079.26

Brand/Style Offered:

No bid

Riddell #1235234

AIS

Kwik Goal/2B3003

No bid

As spec'd

46

Soccer Cones-Low profile
cones 7-3/4 diameter x 3/H, for
drill use. Manufacturer/Style:
Gamecraft Low Profile Cones or
“approved equal”

$1.62| $16.20

$4.92 $24.60

$4.20 $21.00

$3.59

$17.95

Brand/Style Offered:

STS # W8779 2"
priced as pk of 6-

0o ngad

No bid

Champion/SCX

Score Galaxy #943

As spec'd

47

Soccer Cones- weighted
cones atthe base, 28". Orange
Game cones.

$16.50{ $1,980.00

$308.28

$3,082.80

$108.00) $1,080.00

$165.48

$1,654.80

Brand/Style Offered:

STS # W5047006 per
120-priced as each.

Riddell #RRCONE28

Pyramid/3875416

No bid

BS-1040845




S&S Worldwide, Inc.

Riddell

Pyramid School
Products

Score American Soccer

Company

BSN Sports

48

Score Books- 22 lines, 28
game, with team roster and
season schedule.

Ea

$0.00

$4.59 $22.95

$3.51

$17.55

Brand/Style Offered:

No bid

No bid

Brine #SBIRP

No bid

BS-MSSOLB

49

Coaches Board- 9.5 x 15.5
dry-erase board with field
diagram, with dry erase pen.
double sided erase board.

Ea

$6.85| $34.25

$5.99 $29.95

$4.94

$24.70

$5.86

$29.30

Brand/Style Offered:

STS #W7852

No bid

Champion/CB5B

Score Galaxy #690

BS-1240078

50

Goalie Gloves-white latex foam
palm, hook and loop closures.
Manufacturer/Style: Macgregor
Goalie Gloves or “approved
equal’.

Pairs

$14.40

$144.00

Brand/Style Offered:

No bid

No bid

No bid

No bid

As spec'd

TRACK AND FIELD

51

Track Cones-weighted cones
atthe base, 28". Orange Game
cones.

20

Ea

$16.50] $330.00

$308.28 $6,165.60

$1055|  $211.00

$13.79

$275.80

Brand/Style Offered:

STS #W5047006

Riddell #/RRCONE28

Pyramid/3875416

No bid

BS-1040845

52

Low Profile Cones-Low profie
cones 7-3/4 diameter x 3/H, for
drill use. Manufacturer/Style:
Gamecratt Low Profile Cones or
“approved equal’.

20

Ea

$1.62 $4.86

$0.49 $9.80

$0.30

$6.00

Brand/Style Offered:

STS # W8779 2" per
3pks

No bid

Champion/SCX

No bid

As spec'd

53

Stop Watch-16 dual memory,
dual split (lap & cum) 10 hour
range, water resistant, 5 year
lithium battery.
Manufacturer/Style: - Accusplit
AXT725MXT or “approved
equal’.

Ea

13.55 $67.75

$16.21

$81.05

Brand/Style Offered:

No bid

No bid

Accusplit#AX725

No bid

As spec'd

S&S Worldwide, Inc.

Riddell

Pyramid School
Products

Score American Soccer

Company

BSN Sports

SWIMMING

54

Swimming Fins-two toned,
flexible foot pocket, float, closed
ankle for support
Manufacturer/Style: Club Swim
SKU: CSRFO01 or “approved
equal’.

30

Sets

$0.00

$18.93

$567.90

Brand/Style Offered:

No bid

No bid

No Bid

No bid

BS-1371331

55

Kickboards-EVA, polytherane,
small sizes for kids, or specific
stroke work.

Manufacturer/Style:Speedo Jr.

or “approved equal’.

30

Sets

9.35[ $280.50

$0.00

$12.83

$384.90

Brand/Style Offered:

Water Gear/W9309

No bid

No Bid

No bid

BS-1371351

Discount if awarded all items

[ 0%

0%

| 0%

0%

0%




