
ITB# 12-13-002 – RENTAL VEHICLES” 

November 9, 2010 “            
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Group I:

Firm rental price per Day, per

vehicle without insurance $18.84 No Bid

Firm rental price per week, per

vehicle without insurance $131.88 No Bid

Firm rental price per month, per

vehicle without insurance $565.00 $560.00

Group II:

Firm rental price per day, per

vehicle without insurance $20.50 No Bid

Firm rental price per week, per

vehicle without insurance $143.50 No Bid

Firm rental price per month, per

vehicle without insurance $615.00 $560.00

Group III:

Firm rental price per day, per

vehicle without insurance $21.50 No Bid

Firm rental price per week, per

vehicle without insurance $150.50 No Bid



Firm rental price per month, per

vehicle without insurance 645.00$   750.00$     

Group IV:

Firm rental price per day, per

vehicle without insurance $24.84 No Bid

Firm rental price per week, per

vehicle without insurance $173.88 No Bid

Firm rental price per month, per

vehicle without insurance 745.00$   850.00$     

This is only a tabulation of prices submitted and is not an indication of award or responsiveness.

ACME Auto Leasing Non-responsive per section 2.0, Paragraph 2.1 Vehicle Exchange requirement 

within 2 hours.  Also does not offer daily amd weekly rentals.


