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CITY OF BOYNTON BEACH 
INTEROFFICE MEMORANDUM 

  
TO: FILE DATE: September 13, 2012 

FROM: Diane LeRay, CPPO, CPPB, FCPM 
Contract Administrator 

RE: Bid No.: 066-2730-12/DJL – Sod and 
Sod Installation 

 
The Southeast Florida Governmental Purchasing Cooperative encompasses forty-five (45) 
governmental agencies amassed in an effort to allow for cost savings, and cost avoidances to each 
entity by way of utilizing the buying power of combined requirements for common basic 
commodities/services.  
 
To that end, this Invitation to Bid was created in collaboration with twenty (20) Southeast Florida 
Purchasing Cooperative entities to include the City of Boynton Beach within the Miami-Dade, Broward, 
and Palm Beach geographical area.  
 
The City was requested as lead agency to replace an existing contract to provide Sod and Sod 
Installation.  Broward College being the previous lead agency forwarded pertinent specifications. Also, 
the governmental agencies involved submitted their annual usage to create Invitation to Bid # 066-
2730-12/DJL which was released and advertised on August 10, 2012.  No pre-bid conference was held.  
The bid opening occurred on August 29, 2012.   
 
The purpose of this Invitation to Bid is to contract with a two (2) qualified Contractors as Primary and 
Secondary to furnish, deliver and install various species of sod to include but not limited to St. 
Augustine: Floratam, Palmetto, Bahia, Argentine, Pensacola; Bermuda: Tifway 419 “Certified”, Tifway 
419, “Uncertified”, Tifgreen 328, Celebration, Tif Dwarf; Paspalum Sea Dwarf; Sealsle Supreme 
Paspalum “Certified”; Ultimate Flora Zoysia; Hammock Centipede, and Wildflower Sod. 
 
The solicitation document was uploaded to the City’s e-Procurement system, Demandstar.com to 
ensure that a broader vendor base would be invited to participate.  In addition, this method provides for 
administrative savings in response to the reduction of human resources.  All Bidders were advised to 
retrieve the documents from Demandstar.com to ensure that the correct documents were in their 
possession.  
 
In addition to the newspaper advertising, one-hundred and eight (108) firms were invited to bid that 
included fifty-one (51) supplemental bidders derived from the City’s vendor database.  The Invitation to 
Bid was distributed by Demandstar.com. Ten (10) bid packages were issued as plan holders, including 
three (3) firms identified as small business owners.   
 
As a result, a total of five (5) firms submitted bids.  Below is a summary of the bids received: 
 

BIDDERS Location 
  

Mullings Engineering Services, LLC. Sunrise, Florida 
Odum’s Sods, Inc.  Loxahatchee, Florida  
South Florida Grassing, Inc.  Hobe Sound, Florida  
Sunset Sod, Inc.  Miami, Florida  
Tropical Landscaping and Lawn Maintenance, Inc.  Homestead, Florida 
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Each bid response was evaluated based upon responsiveness, responsibility and cost for eight-four 
(84) items. Few of the respondents did not submit licensure nor proof of insurance which was 
requested by the City during evaluation, on the basis that the “City may request documentation 
providing evidence acceptable to the City demonstrating the Bidder’s fiscal responsibilities, prior 
experience and present capability to meet all the Bidder’s obligation set forth in the Bid documents” 
(General Conditions Item 23 “Eligibility”).  Said documents were submitted deeming all bidders 
responsive. Additionally, Contractors disclosed revenues ranging from $250,000 to $5,000,000 as 
evidence of their fiscal responsibility and all contractors were checked to ensure they are current and 
valid to do business in Florida. 
 
All bid prices were evaluated to ensure that the unit price extensions were correct, where applicable.  
There were some errors identified and said Bidders were requested to submit the corrections.  This 
action was validated as per General Conditions, Item 20 “Mistakes” stating, “In the event of extension 
error(s), the unit price will prevail and the Bidder’s total offer will be corrected accordingly.” 
 
As stipulated in the solicitation document; award is made to two (2) bidders (primary and secondary) by 
ITEM and/or by GROUP to geographical areas as North (North Broward/Palm Beach County), South 
(South Broward/Miami-Dade) and Central (Central Broward County) to the lowest, responsive, 
responsible bidder(s) for a period of two (2) initial years with three (3) additional one (1) year renewal 
periods.  Cost adjustments will be allowed after two (2) years with the onerous on the Contractor to 
request for price increase submitting detailed backup documentation.  The primary contractor will be 
offered the largest volume of the work and the secondary will be in place to ensure availability of said 
goods and services. 
 
Based on the evaluations that were conducted in accordance with the Purchasing policies and 
procedures and adherence to certain Florida statutes, the Procurement Services Division recommends 
award of the contract to Mullings Engineering Services, LLC, Odum’s Sods, Inc. South Florida 
Grassing, Inc. Sunset Sod, Inc. and Tropical Landscaping and Lawn Maintenance, Inc, as the lowest 
most responsive, responsible bidders’ as attached in detail.   
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SOD AND SOD INSTALLATION 
 
 

GROUPS 1 – 14 NORTH 
PRIMARY VENDOR 

NORTH 
SECONDARY 

VENDOR 

SOUTH 
PRIMARY VENDOR 

SOUTH 
SECONDARY 

VENDOR 

CENTRAL 
PRIMARY VENDOR 

CENTRAL 
SECONDARY 

VENDOR 

Group 1: St. 
Augustine Floratam 

Tropical Landscaping 
& Lawn Maintenance, 

Inc 
Mullings Engineering 

Services, LLC 
Tropical Landscaping 
& Lawn Maintenance, 

Inc.  
Mullings Engineering 

Services, LLC 
Tropical Landscaping 
& Lawn Maintenance, 

Inc.  
Mullings Engineering 

Services, LLC 

Group 2: St. 
Augustine Palmetto 

Tropical Landscaping 
& Lawn Maintenance, 

Inc. 
Mullings Engineering 

Services, LLC. 
Tropical Landscaping 
& Lawn Maintenance, 

Inc.  
Sunset Sod, Inc.  

Tropical Landscaping 
& Lawn Maintenance, 

Inc.  

TIE: 
Mullings Engineering 

Services, LLC 
 

Sunset Sod, Inc.  

Group 3: Bahia 
Argentine 

Tropical Landscaping 
& Lawn Maintenance, 

Inc. 
Mullings Engineering 

Services, LLC. 
Tropical Landscaping 
& Lawn Maintenance, 

Inc.  
Mullings Engineering 

Services, LLC 
Tropical Landscaping 
& Lawn Maintenance, 

Inc.  
Mullings Engineering 

Services, LLC 

Group 4: Bahia 
Pensacola 

Tropical Landscaping 
& Lawn Maintenance, 

Inc. 
Mullings Engineering 

Services, LLC. 
Tropical Landscaping 
& Lawn Maintenance, 

Inc.  
Mullings Engineering 

Services, LLC 
Tropical Landscaping 
& Lawn Maintenance, 

Inc.  
Mullings Engineering 

Services, LLC 

Group 5: Bermuda 
Tifway 419 Certified 

Tropical Landscaping 
& Lawn Maintenance, 

Inc. 
Mullings Engineering 

Services, LLC. 
Tropical Landscaping 
& Lawn Maintenance, 

Inc.  
Mullings Engineering 

Services, LLC 
Tropical Landscaping 
& Lawn Maintenance, 

Inc. 
Mullings Engineering 

Services, LLC 

Group 6: Bermuda 
Tifway 419 Uncertified 

Tropical Landscaping 
& Lawn Maintenance, 

Inc. 
Mullings Engineering 

Services, LLC 
Tropical Landscaping 
& Lawn Maintenance, 

Inc.  
Mullings Engineering 

Services, LLC 
Tropical Landscaping 
& Lawn Maintenance, 

Inc.  
Mullings Engineering 

Services, LLC 

Group 7: Bermuda 
Tifgreen 328 

Tropical Landscaping 
& Lawn Maintenance, 

Inc. 
Sunset Sod, Inc. 

Tropical Landscaping 
& Lawn Maintenance, 

Inc.  
Sunset Sod, Inc.  

Tropical Landscaping 
& Lawn Maintenance 

Inc.  
Sunset Sod, Inc.  

Group 8: Bermuda 
Celebration 

Tropical Landscaping 
& Lawn Maintenance, 

Inc. 
Mullings Engineering 

Services, LLC 
Tropical Landscaping 
& Lawn Maintenance, 

Inc.  
Mullings Engineering 

Services, LLC 
Tropical Landscaping 
& Lawn Maintenance, 

Inc.  
Mullings Engineering 

Services, LLC 

Group 9: Bermuda Tif 
Dwarf 

Mullings Engineering 
Services, LLC 

Tropical Landscaping 
& Lawn Maintenance, 

Inc. 
Mullings Engineering 

Services, LLC 
Tropical Landscaping 
& Lawn Maintenance, 

Inc.  
Mullings Engineering 

Services, LLC 
Tropical Landscaping 
& Lawn Maintenance, 

Inc.  
Group 10: Paspalum 
Sea Dwarf Sunset Sod, Inc. 

Tropical Landscaping 
& Lawn Maintenance, 

Inc. 
Sunset Sod, Inc.  

Tropical Landscaping 
& Lawn Maintenance, 

Inc.  
Sunset Sod, Inc.  

Tropical Landscaping 
& Lawn Maintenance, 

Inc.  
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Group 11: Sealsle 
Supreme Paspalum 
Certified 

Mullings Engineering 
Services, LLC. 

Tropical Landscaping 
& Lawn Maintenance, 

Inc. 
Mullings Engineering 

Services, LLC 
Tropical Landscaping 
& Lawn Maintenance, 

Inc.  
Mullings Engineering 

Services, LLC 
Tropical Landscaping 
& Lawn Maintenance, 

Inc.  
Group 12: Ultimate 
Flora Zoysia 

Mullings Engineering 
Services, LLC Sunset Sod, Inc. Mullings Engineering 

Services, LLC Sunset Sod, Inc.  Mullings Engineering 
Services, LLC Sunset Sod, Inc.  

Group 13: Hammock 
Centipede 

Tropical Landscaping 
& Lawn Maintenance, 

Inc. 
Sunset Sod, Inc. 

Tropical Landscaping 
& Lawn Maintenance, 

Inc.  
Sunset Sod, Inc. 

Tropical Landscaping 
& Lawn Maintenance, 

Inc.  
Sunset Sod, Inc.  

Group 14: Wildflower 
Sod NO AWARD NO AWARD NO AWARD NO AWARD NO AWARD NO AWARD 

 
 
GROUP 15: Truckload 

Pricing  
NORTH 

PRIMARY VENDOR 
NORTH 

SECONDARY 
VENDOR 

SOUTH 
PRIMARY VENDOR 

SOUTH 
SECONDARY 

VENDOR 

CENTRAL 
PRIMARY VENDOR 

CENTRAL 
SECONDARY 

VENDOR 

Item 72: St. Augustine 
Floratam 

Tropical Landscaping 
& Lawn Maintenance, 

Inc. 
Sunset Sod, Inc. Sunset Sod, Inc.  

Tropical Landscaping 
& Lawn Maintenance, 

Inc.  
Sunset Sod, Inc.  

Tropical Landscaping 
& Lawn Maintenance, 

Inc.  

Item 73: St. Augustine 
Palmetto 

Tropical Landscaping 
& Lawn Maintenance, 

Inc. 
Sunset Sod, Inc. Sunset Sod, Inc.  

Tropical Landscaping 
& Lawn Maintenance, 

Inc.  
Sunset Sod, Inc.  

Tropical Landscaping 
& Lawn Maintenance, 

Inc.  

Item 74: Bahia 
Argentine 

Tropical Landscaping 
& Lawn Maintenance, 

Inc. 
Odum’s Sod, Inc. 

Tropical Landscaping 
& Lawn Maintenance, 

Inc. 
Sunset Sod, Inc.  

Tropical Landscaping 
& Lawn Maintenance, 

Inc.  
Sunset Sod, Inc.  

Item 75: Bahia 
Pensacola 

Tropical Landscaping 
& Lawn Maintenance, 

Inc. 
Mullings Engineering 

Services, LLC. 
Tropical Landscaping 
& Lawn Maintenance, 

Inc.  
Sunset Sod, Inc.  

Tropical Landscaping 
& Lawn Maintenance, 

Inc.  
Sunset Sod, Inc. 

Item 76: Bermuda 
Tifway 419 Certified 

Tropical Landscaping 
& Lawn Maintenance, 

Inc. 
Mullings Engineering 

Services, LLC. 
Tropical Landscaping 
& Lawn Maintenance, 

Inc. 
Mullings Engineering 

Services, LLC 
Tropical Landscaping 
& Lawn Maintenance, 

Inc.  
Mullings Engineering 

Services, LLC. 

Item 77: Bermuda 
Tifway 419 Uncertified 

Tropical Landscaping 
& Lawn Maintenance, 

Inc. 
Mullings Engineering 

Services, LLC. 
Tropical Landscaping 
& Lawn Maintenance, 

Inc.  
Mullings Engineering 

Services, LLC 
Tropical Landscaping 
& Lawn Maintenance, 

Inc.  
Mullings Engineering 

Services, LLC. 
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Item 78: Bermuda 
Tifgreen 328  

Tropical Landscaping 
& Lawn Maintenance, 

Inc. 
Sunset Sod, Inc. 

Tropical Landscaping 
& Lawn Maintenance, 

Inc.  
Sunset Sod, Inc.  

Tropical Landscaping 
& Lawn Maintenance, 

Inc.  
Sunset Sod, Inc. 

Item 79: Bermuda 
Celebration 

Tropical Landscaping 
& Lawn Maintenance, 

Inc. 
Odum’s Sod, Inc. 

Tropical Landscaping 
& Lawn Maintenance, 

Inc.  
Mullings Engineering 

Services, LLC 
Tropical Landscaping 
& Lawn Maintenance, 

Inc.  
Mullings Engineering 

Services, LLC. 

Item 80: Bermuda Tif 
Dwarf 

Tropical Landscaping 
& Lawn Maintenance, 

Inc. 
Sunset Sod, Inc. 

Tropical Landscaping 
& Lawn Maintenance, 

Inc.  
Sunset Sod, Inc.  

Tropical Landscaping 
& Lawn Maintenance, 

Inc.  
Sunset Sod, Inc. 

Item 81: Paspalum 
Sea Dwarf 

Tropical Landscaping 
& Lawn Maintenance, 

Inc. 
Sunset Sod, Inc. Sunset Sod, Inc.  

Tropical Landscaping 
& Lawn Maintenance, 

Inc.  
Sunset Sod, Inc. 

Tropical Landscaping 
& Lawn Maintenance, 

Inc.  
Item 82: Sealsle 
Supreme Paspalum 
Certified 

South Florida 
Grassing, Inc. 

Tropical Landscaping 
& Lawn Maintenance, 

Inc. 
South Florida 
Grassing, Inc.  

Tropical Landscaping 
& Lawn Maintenance, 

Inc.  
South Florida 
Grassing, Inc. 

Tropical Landscaping 
& Lawn Maintenance, 

Inc.  
Item 83: Ultimate 
Flora Zoysia 

Mullings Engineering 
Services, LLC Sunset Sod, Inc. Mullings Engineering 

Services, LLC Sunset Sod, Inc.  Mullings Engineering 
Services, LLC. Sunset Sod, Inc. 

Item 84: Hammock 
Centipede Sunset Sod, Inc. 

Tropical Landscaping 
& Lawn Maintenance, 

Inc. 
Sunset Sod, Inc.  

Tropical Landscaping 
& Lawn Maintenance, 

Inc.  
Sunset Sod, Inc. 

Tropical Landscaping 
& Lawn Maintenance, 

Inc.  
Item 85: Wildflower 
Sod NO AWARD NO AWARD NO AWARD NO AWARD NO AWARD NO AWARD 
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NORTH 
      

GROUP 1 ST. AUGUSTINE "FLORATAM" 
   PRIMARY SECONDARY 

   

TROPICAL LANDSCAPING 
AND LAWN 

MAINTENANCE 
(Homestead, FL) 

MULLINGS 
ENGINEERING 
SERVICES, LLC 

(Sunrise, FL) 
1.0 Under 2,000 SF, picked up by agency $0.22 $0.225 
2.0 Under 2,000 SF, delivered & unloaded $0.24 $0.225 

3.0 
2,000 SF or more - but less than truckload, 
delivered& unloaded $0.22 $0.225 

4.0 Sod Installation - for sod provided by others $0.04 $0.05 
5.0 Sod Installation only - at time of delivery $0.05 $0.05 

GROUP 1 - TOTAL: $0.77 $0.78 
      

GROUP 2 ST. AUGUSTINE "PALMETTO" 
   PRIMARY SECONDARY 

   

TROPICAL LANDSCAPING 
AND LAWN 

MAINTENANCE 
(Homestead, FL) 

MULLINGS 
ENGINEERING 
SERVICES, LLC 

(Sunrise, FL) 
6.0 Under 2,000 SF, picked up by agency $0.22 $0.24 
7.0 Under 2,000 SF, delivered & unloaded $0.24 $0.24  

8.0 
2,000 SF or more - but less than truckload, 
delivered& unloaded $0.23 $0.24  

9.0 Sod Installation - for sod provided by others $0.04 $0.05  
10.0 Sod Installation only - at time of delivery $0.05 $0.05  

GROUP 2 - TOTAL: $0.78 $0.82  
      

GROUP 3 BAHIA "ARGENTINE" 
   PRIMARY SECONDARY 

   

TROPICAL LANDSCAPING 
AND LAWN 

MAINTENANCE 
(Homestead, FL) 

MULLINGS 
ENGINEERING 
SERVICES, LLC 

(Sunrise, FL) 
11.0 Under 2,000 SF, picked up by agency $0.15 $0.16 
12.0 Under 2,000 SF, delivered & unloaded $0.15 $0.16 

13.0 
2,000 SF or more - but less than truckload, 
delivered& unloaded $0.15 $0.16 

14.0 Sod Installation - for sod provided by others $0.04 $0.05 
15.0 Sod Installation only - at time of delivery $0.05 $0.05 

GROUP 3 - TOTAL: $0.54 $0.58 
      

GROUP 4 BAHIA "PENSACOLA" 
   PRIMARY SECONDARY 

   

TROPICAL LANDSCAPING 
AND LAWN 

MAINTENANCE 
(Homestead, FL) 

MULLINGS 
ENGINEERING 
SERVICES, LLC 

(Sunrise, FL) 
16.0 Under 2,000 SF, picked up by agency $0.15 $0.16 
17.0 Under 2,000 SF, delivered & unloaded $0.15 $0.16 
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18.0 
2,000 SF or more - but less than truckload, 
delivered& unloaded $0.15 $0.16 

19.0 Sod Installation - for sod provided by others $0.04 $0.05 
20.0 Sod Installation only - at time of delivery $0.05 $0.05 

GROUP 4 - TOTAL: $0.54 $0.58 
      

GROUP 5 BERMUDA TIFWAY 419 "CERTIFIED" 
   PRIMARY SECONDARY 

   

TROPICAL LANDSCAPING 
AND LAWN 

MAINTENANCE 
(Homestead, FL) 

MULLINGS 
ENGINEERING 
SERVICES, LLC 

(Sunrise, FL) 
21.0 Under 2,000 SF, picked up by agency $0.24 $0.27 
22.0 Under 2,000 SF, delivered & unloaded $0.25 $0.27 

23.0 
2,000 SF or more - but less than truckload, 
delivered& unloaded $0.25 $0.27 

24.0 Sod Installation - for sod provided by others $0.04 $0.05 
25.0 Sod Installation only - at time of delivery $0.05 $0.05 

26.0 
42" Wide Rolls, delivered, unloaded, installed 
(NOTE: Estimate quantity 20,000 SF/Year) $0.30 $0.33 

GROUP 5 - TOTAL: $1.13 $1.24 
      

GROUP 6 BERMUDA TIFWAY 419 "UNCERTIFIED" 
   PRIMARY SECONDARY 

   

TROPICAL LANDSCAPING 
AND LAWN 

MAINTENANCE 
(Homestead, FL) 

MULLINGS 
ENGINEERING 
SERVICES, LLC 

(Sunrise, FL) 
27.0 Under 2,000 SF, picked up by agency $0.23 $0.27 
28.0 Under 2,000 SF, delivered & unloaded $0.24 $0.27 

29.0 
2,000 SF or more - but less than truckload, 
delivered& unloaded $0.24 $0.27 

30.0 Sod Installation - for sod provided by others $0.04 $0.05 
31.0 Sod Installation only - at time of delivery $0.05 $0.05 

GROUP 6 - TOTAL: $0.80 $0.91 
      

GROUP 7 BERMUDA TIFGREEN 328 
   PRIMARY SECONDARY 

   

TROPICAL LANDSCAPING 
AND LAWN 

MAINTENANCE 
(Homestead, FL) 

SUNSET SOD, INC. 
(Miami, FL) 

32.0 Under 2,000 SF, picked up by agency $0.45 $0.65 
33.0 Under 2,000 SF, delivered & unloaded $0.45 $0.69 

34.0 
2,000 SF or more - but less than truckload, 
delivered& unloaded $0.45 $0.68 

35.0 Sod Installation - for sod provided by others $0.04 $0.05 
36.0 Sod Installation only - at time of delivery $0.05 $0.05 

GROUP 7 - TOTAL: $1.44 $2.12 
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GROUP 8 BERMUDA CELEBRATION 

   PRIMARY SECONDARY 

   

TROPICAL LANDSCAPING 
AND LAWN 

MAINTENANCE 
(Homestead, FL) 

MULLINGS 
ENGINEERING 
SERVICES, LLC 

(Sunrise, FL) 
37.0 Under 2,000 SF, picked up by agency $0.24 $0.28 
38.0 Under 2,000 SF, delivered & unloaded $0.25 $0.28 

39.0 
2,000 SF or more - but less than truckload, 
delivered& unloaded $0.25 $0.28 

40.0 Sod Installation - for sod provided by others $0.04 $0.05 
41.0 Sod Installation only - at time of delivery $0.05 $0.05 

GROUP 8 - TOTAL: $0.83 $0.94 
      

GROUP 9 BERMUDA TIF DWARF 
   PRIMARY SECONDARY 

   

MULLINGS ENGINEERING 
SERVICES, LLC (Sunrise, 

FL) 

TROPICAL 
LANDSCAPING AND 

LAWN MAINTENANCE 
(Homestead, FL) 

42.0 Under 2,000 SF, picked up by agency $1.35 $1.25 
43.0 Under 2,000 SF, delivered & unloaded $1.35 $1.45 

44.0 
2,000 SF or more - but less than truckload, 
delivered& unloaded $1.35 $1.45 

45.0 Sod Installation - for sod provided by others $0.05 $0.04 
46.0 Sod Installation only - at time of delivery $0.05 $0.05 

GROUP 9 - TOTAL: $4.15 $4.24 
      

GROUP 10 PASPALUM SEA DWARF 
   PRIMARY SECONDARY 

   

SUNSET SOD, INC. 
(Miami, FL) 

TROPICAL 
LANDSCAPING AND 

LAWN MAINTENANCE 
(Homestead, FL) 

47.0 Under 2,000 SF, picked up by agency $0.85 $1.39 
48.0 Under 2,000 SF, delivered & unloaded $0.90 $1.39 

49.0 
2,000 SF or more - but less than truckload, 
delivered& unloaded $0.89 $1.39 

50.0 Sod Installation - for sod provided by others $0.05 $0.04 
51.0 Sod Installation only - at time of delivery $0.05 $0.05 

GROUP 10 - TOTAL: $2.74 $4.26 
      
GROUP 11 SEALSLE SUPREME PASPALUM CERTIFIED 

   PRIMARY SECONDARY 

   

MULLINGS ENGINEERING 
SERVICES, LLC (Sunrise, 

FL) 

TROPICAL 
LANDSCAPING AND 

LAWN MAINTENANCE 
(Homestead, FL) 

52.0 Under 2,000 SF, picked up by agency $0.52 $1.30 
53.0 Under 2,000 SF, delivered & unloaded $0.52 $1.35 



Page 9 of 35 

54.0 
2,000 SF or more - but less than truckload, 
delivered& unloaded $0.52 $0.65 

55.0 Sod Installation - for sod provided by others $0.05 $0.04 
56.0 Sod Installation only - at time of delivery $0.05 $0.05 

GROUP 11 - TOTAL: $1.66 $3.39 
      
GROUP 12 ULTIMATE FLORA® ZOYSIA 

   PRIMARY SECONDARY 

   

MULLINGS ENGINEERING 
SERVICES, LLC (Sunrise, 

FL) 

SUNSET SOD, INC. 
(Miami, FL) 

57.0 Under 2,000 SF, picked up by agency $0.40 $0.45 
58.0 Under 2,000 SF, delivered & unloaded $0.40 $0.49 

59.0 
2,000 SF or more - but less than truckload, 
delivered& unloaded $0.40 $0.48 

60.0 Sod Installation - for sod provided by others $0.05 $0.05 
61.0 Sod Installation only - at time of delivery $0.05 $0.05 

GROUP 12 - TOTAL: $1.30 $1.52 
      
GROUP 13 HAMMOCK® CENTIPEDE 

   PRIMARY SECONDARY 

   

TROPICAL LANDSCAPING 
AND LAWN 

MAINTENANCE 
(Homestead, FL) 

SUNSET SOD, INC. 
(Miami, FL) 

62.0 Under 2,000 SF, picked up by agency $0.35 $1.00 
63.0 Under 2,000 SF, delivered & unloaded $0.35 $1.10 

64.0 
2,000 SF or more - but less than truckload, 
delivered& unloaded $0.35 $1.05 

65.0 Sod Installation - for sod provided by others $0.04 $0.05 
66.0 Sod Installation only - at time of delivery $0.05 $0.05 

GROUP 13 - TOTAL: $1.14 $3.25 
      
GROUP 14 WILDFLOWER SOD 

   PRIMARY SECONDARY 
67.0 Under 2,000 SF, picked up by agency NO BID NO BID  
68.0 Under 2,000 SF, delivered & unloaded NO BID NO BID  

69.0 
2,000 SF or more - but less than truckload, 
delivered& unloaded NO BID NO BID  

70.0 Sod Installation - for sod provided by others NO BID NO BID  
71.0 Sod Installation only - at time of delivery NO BID NO BID  

GROUP 14 - TOTAL: NO BID NO BID  
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SOUTH 
    

GROUP 1 ST. AUGUSTINE "FLORATAM" 
  PRIMARY SECONDARY 

  

TROPICAL 
LANDSCAPING & LAWN 

MAINTENANCE, INC. 
(Homestead, FL) 

MULLINGS 
ENGINEERING 
SERVICES, LLC 

(Sunrise, FL) 

1.0 Under 2,000 SF, picked up by agency $0.22 $0.225 
2.0 Under 2,000 SF, delivered & unloaded $0.24 $0.225 

3.0 
2,000 SF or more - but less than truckload, 
delivered& unloaded $0.22 $0.225 

4.0 Sod Installation - for sod provided by others $0.04 $0.05 
5.0 Sod Installation only - at time of delivery $0.05 $0.05 

GROUP 1 - TOTAL: $0.77 $0.78 
    

GROUP 2 ST. AUGUSTINE "PALMETTO" 
  PRIMARY SECONDARY 

  

TROPICAL 
LANDSCAPING & LAWN 

MAINTENANCE, INC. 
(Homestead, FL) 

SUNSET SOD, INC. 
(Miami, FL.) 

6.0 Under 2,000 SF, picked up by agency $0.22 $0.22 
7.0 Under 2,000 SF, delivered & unloaded $0.24 $0.26  

8.0 
2,000 SF or more - but less than truckload, 
delivered& unloaded $0.23 $0.24  

9.0 Sod Installation - for sod provided by others $0.04 $0.035  
10.0 Sod Installation only - at time of delivery $0.05 $0.05  

GROUP 2 - TOTAL: $0.78  $0.81  
    

GROUP 3 BAHIA "ARGENTINE" 
  PRIMARY SECONDARY 

  

TROPICAL 
LANDSCAPING & LAWN 

MAINTENANCE, INC. 
(Homestead, FL) 

MULLINGS 
ENGINEERING 
SERVICES, LLC 

(Sunrise, FL) 

11.0 Under 2,000 SF, picked up by agency $0.15 $0.16 
12.0 Under 2,000 SF, delivered & unloaded $0.15 $0.16 

13.0 
2,000 SF or more - but less than truckload, 
delivered& unloaded $0.15 $0.16 

14.0 Sod Installation - for sod provided by others $0.04 $0.05 
15.0 Sod Installation only - at time of delivery $0.05 $0.05 

GROUP 3 - TOTAL: $0.54 $0.58 
    

GROUP 4 BAHIA "PENSACOLA" 
  PRIMARY SECONDARY 

  

TROPICAL 
LANDSCAPING & LAWN 

MAINTENANCE, INC. 
(Homestead, FL) 

MULLINGS 
ENGINEERING 
SERVICES, LLC 

(Sunrise, FL) 

16.0 Under 2,000 SF, picked up by agency $0.15 $0.16 
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17.0 Under 2,000 SF, delivered & unloaded $0.15 $0.16 

18.0 
2,000 SF or more - but less than truckload, 
delivered& unloaded $0.15 $0.16 

19.0 Sod Installation - for sod provided by others $0.04 $0.05 
20.0 Sod Installation only - at time of delivery $0.05 $0.05 

GROUP 4 - TOTAL: $0.54 $0.58 
    

GROUP 5 BERMUDA TIFWAY 419 "CERTIFIED" 
  PRIMARY SECONDARY 

  

TROPICAL 
LANDSCAPING & LAWN 

MAINTENANCE, INC. 
(Homestead, FL) 

MULLINGS 
ENGINEERING 
SERVICES, LLC 

(Sunrise, FL) 

21.0 Under 2,000 SF, picked up by agency $0.24 $0.27 
22.0 Under 2,000 SF, delivered & unloaded $0.25 $0.27 

23.0 
2,000 SF or more - but less than truckload, 
delivered& unloaded $0.25 $0.27 

24.0 Sod Installation - for sod provided by others $0.04 $0.05 
25.0 Sod Installation only - at time of delivery $0.05 $0.05 

26.0 
42" Wide Rolls, delivered, unloaded, installed 
(NOTE: Estimate quantity 20,000 SF/Year) $0.30 $0.33 

GROUP 5 - TOTAL: $1.13 $1.24 
    

GROUP 6 BERMUDA TIFWAY 419 "UNCERTIFIED" 
  PRIMARY SECONDARY 

  

TROPICAL 
LANDSCAPING & LAWN 

MAINTENANCE, INC. 
(Homestead, FL) 

MULLINGS 
ENGINEERING 
SERVICES, LLC 

(Sunrise, FL) 

27.0 Under 2,000 SF, picked up by agency $0.23 $0.27 
28.0 Under 2,000 SF, delivered & unloaded $0.24 $0.27 

29.0 
2,000 SF or more - but less than truckload, 
delivered& unloaded $0.24 $0.27 

30.0 Sod Installation - for sod provided by others $0.04 $0.05 
31.0 Sod Installation only - at time of delivery $0.05 $0.05 

GROUP 6 - TOTAL: $0.80 $0.91 
    

GROUP 7 BERMUDA TIFGREEN 328 
  PRIMARY SECONDARY 

  

TROPICAL 
LANDSCAPING & LAWN 

MAINTENANCE, INC. 
(Homestead, FL) 

SUNSET SOD, INC. 
(Miami, FL.) 

32.0 Under 2,000 SF, picked up by agency $0.45 $0.65 
33.0 Under 2,000 SF, delivered & unloaded $0.45 $0.68 

34.0 
2,000 SF or more - but less than truckload, 
delivered& unloaded $0.45 $0.67 

35.0 Sod Installation - for sod provided by others $0.04 $0.035 
36.0 Sod Installation only - at time of delivery $0.05 $0.05 

GROUP 7 - TOTAL: $1.44 $2.09 
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GROUP 8 BERMUDA CELEBRATION 

  PRIMARY SECONDARY 

  

TROPICAL 
LANDSCAPING & LAWN 

MAINTENANCE, INC. 
(Homestead, FL) 

MULLINGS 
ENGINEERING 
SERVICES, LLC 

(Sunrise, FL) 

37.0 Under 2,000 SF, picked up by agency $0.24 $0.28 
38.0 Under 2,000 SF, delivered & unloaded $0.25 $0.28 

39.0 
2,000 SF or more - but less than truckload, 
delivered& unloaded $0.25 $0.28 

40.0 Sod Installation - for sod provided by others $0.04 $0.05 
41.0 Sod Installation only - at time of delivery $0.05 $0.05 

GROUP 8 - TOTAL: $0.83 $0.94 
    

GROUP 9 BERMUDA TIF DWARF 
  PRIMARY SECONDARY 

  

MULLINGS ENGINEERING 
SERVICES, LLC (Sunrise, 

FL) 

TROPICAL 
LANDSCAPING & LAWN 

MAINTENANCE, INC. 
(Homestead, FL) 

42.0 Under 2,000 SF, picked up by agency $1.35 $1.25 
43.0 Under 2,000 SF, delivered & unloaded $1.35 $1.45 

44.0 
2,000 SF or more - but less than truckload, 
delivered& unloaded $1.35 $1.45 

45.0 Sod Installation - for sod provided by others $0.05 $0.04 
46.0 Sod Installation only - at time of delivery $0.05 $0.05 

GROUP 9 - TOTAL: $4.15 $4.24 
    

GROUP 10 PASPALUM SEA DWARF 
  PRIMARY SECONDARY 

  

SUNSET SOD, INC. 
(Miami, FL.) 

TROPICAL 
LANDSCAPING & LAWN 

MAINTENANCE, INC. 
(Homestead, FL) 

47.0 Under 2,000 SF, picked up by agency $0.85 $1.39 
48.0 Under 2,000 SF, delivered & unloaded $0.90 $1.39 

49.0 
2,000 SF or more - but less than truckload, 
delivered& unloaded $0.89 $1.39 

50.0 Sod Installation - for sod provided by others $0.035 $0.04 
51.0 Sod Installation only - at time of delivery $0.05 $0.05 

GROUP 10 - TOTAL: $2.73 $4.26 
    
GROUP 11 SEALSLE SUPREME PASPALUM CERTIFIED 

  PRIMARY SECONDARY 

  

MULLINGS ENGINEERING 
SERVICES, LLC (Sunrise, 

FL) 

TROPICAL 
LANDSCAPING & LAWN 

MAINTENANCE, INC. 
(Homestead, FL) 

52.0 Under 2,000 SF, picked up by agency $0.52 $1.30 
53.0 Under 2,000 SF, delivered & unloaded $0.52 $1.35 



Page 13 of 35 

54.0 
2,000 SF or more - but less than truckload, 
delivered& unloaded $0.52 $0.65 

55.0 Sod Installation - for sod provided by others $0.05 $0.04 
56.0 Sod Installation only - at time of delivery $0.05 $0.05 

GROUP 11 - TOTAL: $1.66 $3.39 
    
GROUP 12 ULTIMATE FLORA® ZOYSIA 

  PRIMARY SECONDARY 

  

MULLINGS ENGINEERING 
SERVICES, LLC (Sunrise, 

FL) 

SUNSET SOD, INC. 
(Miami, FL.) 

57.0 Under 2,000 SF, picked up by agency $0.40 $0.45 
58.0 Under 2,000 SF, delivered & unloaded $0.40 $0.48 

59.0 
2,000 SF or more - but less than truckload, 
delivered& unloaded $0.40 $0.47 

60.0 Sod Installation - for sod provided by others $0.05 $0.04 
61.0 Sod Installation only - at time of delivery $0.05 $0.05 

GROUP 12 - TOTAL: $1.30 $1.49 
    
GROUP 13 HAMMOCK® CENTIPEDE 

  PRIMARY SECONDARY 

  

TROPICAL 
LANDSCAPING & LAWN 

MAINTENANCE, INC. 
(Homestead, FL) 

SUNSET SOD, INC. 
(Miami, FL.) 

62.0 Under 2,000 SF, picked up by agency $0.35 $1.00 
63.0 Under 2,000 SF, delivered & unloaded $0.35 $1.10 

64.0 
2,000 SF or more - but less than truckload, 
delivered& unloaded $0.35 $1.05 

65.0 Sod Installation - for sod provided by others $0.04 $0.04 
66.0 Sod Installation only - at time of delivery $0.05 $0.05 

GROUP 13 - TOTAL: $1.14 $3.24 
      
GROUP 14 WILDFLOWER SOD 

   PRIMARY SECONDARY 
67.0 Under 2,000 SF, picked up by agency NO BID NO BID  
68.0 Under 2,000 SF, delivered & unloaded NO BID NO BID  

69.0 
2,000 SF or more - but less than truckload, 
delivered& unloaded NO BID NO BID  

70.0 Sod Installation - for sod provided by others NO BID NO BID  
71.0 Sod Installation only - at time of delivery NO BID NO BID  

GROUP 14 - TOTAL: NO BID NO BID  
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CENTRAL 
          

GROUP 1 ST. AUGUSTINE "FLORATAM"     
   PRIMARY SECONDARY     

   

TROPICAL LANDSCAPING & 
LAWN MAINTENANCE, INC. 

(Homestead, FL) 

MULLINGS ENGINEERING 
SERVICES, LLC (Sunrise, FL) 

    
1.0 Under 2,000 SF, picked up by agency $0.22 $0.225     
2.0 Under 2,000 SF, delivered & unloaded $0.24 $0.225     

3.0 
2,000 SF or more - but less than truckload, delivered& 
unloaded $0.22 $0.225     

4.0 Sod Installation - for sod provided by others $0.04 $0.05     
5.0 Sod Installation only - at time of delivery $0.05 $0.05     

GROUP 1 - TOTAL: $0.77 $0.78     
          

GROUP 2 ST. AUGUSTINE "PALMETTO"     

   PRIMARY SECONDARY 
SECONDARY 

(TIE) 

   

TROPICAL LANDSCAPING & 
LAWN MAINTENANCE, INC. 

(Homestead, FL) 

MULLINGS ENGINEERING 
SERVICES, LLC (Sunrise, FL) 

SUNSET SOD, 
INC. (MIAMI, FL) 

6.0 Under 2,000 SF, picked up by agency $0.22 $0.24 $0.22 
7.0 Under 2,000 SF, delivered & unloaded $0.24 $0.24  $0.26 

8.0 
2,000 SF or more - but less than truckload, delivered& 
unloaded $0.23 $0.24  $0.25 

9.0 Sod Installation - for sod provided by others $0.04 $0.05  $0.035 
10.0 Sod Installation only - at time of delivery $0.05 $0.05  $0.05 

GROUP 2 - TOTAL: $0.78 $0.82  $0.82 
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GROUP 3 BAHIA "ARGENTINE"     

   PRIMARY SECONDARY     

   

TROPICAL LANDSCAPING & 
LAWN MAINTENANCE, INC. 

(Homestead, FL) 

MULLINGS ENGINEERING 
SERVICES, LLC (Sunrise, FL) 

    
11.0 Under 2,000 SF, picked up by agency $0.15 $0.16     
12.0 Under 2,000 SF, delivered & unloaded $0.15 $0.16     

13.0 
2,000 SF or more - but less than truckload, delivered& 
unloaded $0.15 $0.16     

14.0 Sod Installation - for sod provided by others $0.04 $0.05     
15.0 Sod Installation only - at time of delivery $0.05 $0.05     

GROUP 3 - TOTAL: $0.54 $0.58     
          

GROUP 4 BAHIA "PENSACOLA"     
   PRIMARY SECONDARY     

   

TROPICAL LANDSCAPING & 
LAWN MAINTENANCE, INC. 

(Homestead, FL) 

MULLINGS ENGINEERING 
SERVICES, LLC (Sunrise, FL) 

    
16.0 Under 2,000 SF, picked up by agency $0.15 $0.16     
17.0 Under 2,000 SF, delivered & unloaded $0.15 $0.16     

18.0 
2,000 SF or more - but less than truckload, delivered& 
unloaded $0.15 $0.16     

19.0 Sod Installation - for sod provided by others $0.04 $0.05     
20.0 Sod Installation only - at time of delivery $0.05 $0.05     

GROUP 4 - TOTAL: $0.54 $0.58     
          

GROUP 5 BERMUDA TIFWAY 419 "CERTIFIED"     
   PRIMARY SECONDARY     

   

TROPICAL LANDSCAPING & 
LAWN MAINTENANCE, INC. 

(Homestead, FL) 

MULLINGS ENGINEERING 
SERVICES, LLC (Sunrise, FL) 

    
21.0 Under 2,000 SF, picked up by agency $0.24 $0.27     
22.0 Under 2,000 SF, delivered & unloaded $0.25 $0.27     
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23.0 
2,000 SF or more - but less than truckload, delivered& 
unloaded $0.25 $0.27     

24.0 Sod Installation - for sod provided by others $0.04 $0.05     
25.0 Sod Installation only - at time of delivery $0.05 $0.05     

26.0 
42" Wide Rolls, delivered, unloaded, installed (NOTE: 
Estimate quantity 20,000 SF/Year) $0.30 $0.33     

GROUP 5 - TOTAL: $1.13 $1.24     
          

GROUP 6 BERMUDA TIFWAY 419 "UNCERTIFIED"     
   PRIMARY SECONDARY     

   

TROPICAL LANDSCAPING & 
LAWN MAINTENANCE, INC. 

(Homestead, FL) 

MULLINGS ENGINEERING 
SERVICES, LLC (Sunrise, FL) 

    
27.0 Under 2,000 SF, picked up by agency $0.23 $0.27     
28.0 Under 2,000 SF, delivered & unloaded $0.24 $0.27     

29.0 
2,000 SF or more - but less than truckload, delivered& 
unloaded $0.24 $0.27     

30.0 Sod Installation - for sod provided by others $0.04 $0.05     
31.0 Sod Installation only - at time of delivery $0.05 $0.05     

GROUP 6 - TOTAL: $0.80 $0.91     
          

GROUP 7 BERMUDA TIFGREEN 328     
   PRIMARY SECONDARY     

   

TROPICAL LANDSCAPING & 
LAWN MAINTENANCE, INC. 

(Homestead, FL) 

SUNSET SOD, INC. (Miami, 
FL.) 

    
32.0 Under 2,000 SF, picked up by agency $0.45 $0.65     
33.0 Under 2,000 SF, delivered & unloaded $0.45 $0.68     

34.0 
2,000 SF or more - but less than truckload, delivered& 
unloaded $0.45 $0.67     

35.0 Sod Installation - for sod provided by others $0.04 $0.035     
36.0 Sod Installation only - at time of delivery $0.05 $0.05     

GROUP 7 - TOTAL: $1.44 $2.09     
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GROUP 8 BERMUDA CELEBRATION     
   PRIMARY SECONDARY     

   

TROPICAL LANDSCAPING & 
LAWN MAINTENANCE, INC. 

(Homestead, FL) 

MULLINGS ENGINEERING 
SERVICES, LLC (Sunrise, FL) 

    
37.0 Under 2,000 SF, picked up by agency $0.24 $0.28     
38.0 Under 2,000 SF, delivered & unloaded $0.25 $0.28     

39.0 
2,000 SF or more - but less than truckload, delivered& 
unloaded $0.25 $0.28     

40.0 Sod Installation - for sod provided by others $0.04 $0.05     
41.0 Sod Installation only - at time of delivery $0.05 $0.05     

GROUP 8 - TOTAL: $0.83 $0.94     
          

GROUP 9 BERMUDA TIF DWARF     
   PRIMARY SECONDARY     

   

MULLINGS ENGINEERING 
SERVICES, LLC (Sunrise, FL) 

TROPICAL LANDSCAPING & 
LAWN MAINTENANCE, INC. 

(Homestead, FL) 
    

42.0 Under 2,000 SF, picked up by agency $1.35 $1.25     
43.0 Under 2,000 SF, delivered & unloaded $1.35 $1.45     

44.0 
2,000 SF or more - but less than truckload, delivered& 
unloaded $1.35 $1.45     

45.0 Sod Installation - for sod provided by others $0.05 $0.04     
46.0 Sod Installation only - at time of delivery $0.05 $0.05     

GROUP 9 - TOTAL: $4.15 $4.24     
          

GROUP 10 PASPALUM SEA DWARF     
   PRIMARY SECONDARY     

   

SUNSET SOD, INC. (Miami, FL.) 
TROPICAL LANDSCAPING & 
LAWN MAINTENANCE, INC. 

(Homestead, FL) 
    

47.0 Under 2,000 SF, picked up by agency $0.85 $1.39     
48.0 Under 2,000 SF, delivered & unloaded $0.90 $1.39     
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49.0 
2,000 SF or more - but less than truckload, delivered& 
unloaded $0.89 $1.39     

50.0 Sod Installation - for sod provided by others $0.035 $0.04     
51.0 Sod Installation only - at time of delivery $0.05 $0.05     

GROUP 10 - TOTAL: $2.73 $4.26     
          

GROUP 11 SEALSLE SUPREME PASPALUM CERTIFIED     
   PRIMARY SECONDARY     

   

MULLINGS ENGINEERING 
SERVICES, LLC (Sunrise, FL) 

TROPICAL LANDSCAPING & 
LAWN MAINTENANCE, INC. 

(Homestead, FL) 
    

52.0 Under 2,000 SF, picked up by agency $0.52 $1.30     
53.0 Under 2,000 SF, delivered & unloaded $0.52 $1.35     

54.0 
2,000 SF or more - but less than truckload, delivered& 
unloaded $0.52 $0.65     

55.0 Sod Installation - for sod provided by others $0.05 $0.04     
56.0 Sod Installation only - at time of delivery $0.05 $0.05     

GROUP 11 - TOTAL: $1.66 $3.39     
          

GROUP 12 ULTIMATE FLORA® ZOYSIA     
   PRIMARY SECONDARY     

   
MULLINGS ENGINEERING 

SERVICES, LLC (Sunrise, FL) 
SUNSET SOD, INC. (Miami, 

FL.)     
57.0 Under 2,000 SF, picked up by agency $0.40 $0.45     
58.0 Under 2,000 SF, delivered & unloaded $0.40 $0.48     

59.0 
2,000 SF or more - but less than truckload, delivered& 
unloaded $0.40 $0.47     

60.0 Sod Installation - for sod provided by others $0.05 $0.04     
61.0 Sod Installation only - at time of delivery $0.05 $0.05     

GROUP 12 - TOTAL: $1.30 $1.49     
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GROUP 13 HAMMOCK® CENTIPEDE     

   PRIMARY SECONDARY     

   

TROPICAL LANDSCAPING & 
LAWN MAINTENANCE, INC. 

(Homestead, FL) 

SUNSET SOD, INC. (Miami, 
FL.) 

    
62.0 Under 2,000 SF, picked up by agency $0.35 $1.00     
63.0 Under 2,000 SF, delivered & unloaded $0.35 $1.10     

64.0 
2,000 SF or more - but less than truckload, delivered& 
unloaded $0.35 $1.05     

65.0 Sod Installation - for sod provided by others $0.04 $0.04     
66.0 Sod Installation only - at time of delivery $0.05 $0.05     

GROUP 13 - TOTAL: $1.14 $3.24     
          

GROUP 14 WILDFLOWER SOD     
   PRIMARY SECONDARY     

67.0 Under 2,000 SF, picked up by agency NO BID NO BID     
68.0 Under 2,000 SF, delivered & unloaded NO BID NO BID     

69.0 
2,000 SF or more - but less than truckload, delivered& 
unloaded NO BID NO BID     

70.0 Sod Installation - for sod provided by others NO BID NO BID     
71.0 Sod Installation only - at time of delivery NO BID NO BID     

GROUP 14 - TOTAL: NO BID NO BID     
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NORTH 
       

GROUP 15      
  ST. AUGUSTINE FLORATAM 

ITEM 72  PRIMARY SECONDARY 

   
TROPICAL LANDSCAPING & LAWN MAINTENANCE, INC. 

(Homestead, FL) 
SUNSET SOD, INC.(Miami, FL.) 

  Truckload Rate per SF $0.2596 $0.26 
  Truckload Price $2,336.40 $2,340.00 

  
Number of pallets per truckload/SF per 
pallet 

18 PALLETS/ 500 SF PER PALLET 18 PALLETS/ 500 SF PER PALLET 

      
ITEM 73 ST. AUGUSTINE PALMETTO 

   PRIMARY SECONDARY 

   
TROPICAL LANDSCAPING & LAWN MAINTENANCE, INC. 

(Homestead, FL) 
SUNSET SOD, INC.(Miami, FL.) 

  Truckload Rate per SF $0.2596 $0.27 
  Truckload Price $2,336.40 $2,430.00 

  
Number of pallets per truckload/SF per 
pallet 

18 PALLETS/ 500 SF PER PALLET 18 PALLETS/ 500 SF PER PALLET 

      
ITEM 74 BAHIA ARGENTINE 

   PRIMARY SECONDARY 

   
TROPICAL LANDSCAPING & LAWN MAINTENANCE, INC. 

(Homestead, FL) 

ODUM'S SOD, INC.(Loxahatchee, 
FL.) 

  Truckload Rate per SF $0.177 $0.20 
  Truckload Price $1,433.70 $1,440.00 

  
Number of pallets per truckload/SF per 
pallet 

18 PALLETS/450 SF PER PALLET 
16 PALLETS/ (450) 7,200 SF PER 

PALLET 

      
ITEM 75 BAHIA PENSACOLA 

   PRIMARY SECONDARY 



Page 21 of 35 

   
TROPICAL LANDSCAPING & LAWN MAINTENANCE, INC. 

(Homestead, FL) 

MULLINGS ENGINEERING 
SERVICES, LLC (Sunrise, FL.) 

  Truckload Rate per SF $0.177 $0.21 
  Truckload Price $1,433.70 $1,344.00 

  
Number of pallets per truckload/SF per 
pallet 

18 PALLETS/450 SF PER PALLET 16 PALLETS/ 400 SF PER PALLET 

      
ITEM 76 BERMUDA TIFWAY 419 "CERTIFIED" 

   PRIMARY SECONDARY 

   
TROPICAL LANDSCAPING & LAWN MAINTENANCE, INC. 

(Homestead, FL) 

MULLINGS ENGINEERING 
SERVICES, LLC (Sunrise, FL.) 

  Truckload Rate per SF $0.25 $0.32 
  Truckload Price $2,025.00 $2,592.00 

  
Number of pallets per truckload/SF per 
pallet 

18 PALLETS/ 450 SF PER PALLET 
18 PALLETS/450 SF PER PALLET 

      
ITEM 77 BERMUDA TIFWAY 419 "UNCERTIFIED"  

   PRIMARY SECONDARY 

   
TROPICAL LANDSCAPING & LAWN MAINTENANCE, INC. 

(Homestead, FL) 

MULLINGS ENGINEERING 
SERVICES, LLC (Sunrise, FL.) 

  Truckload Rate per SF $0.24 $0.32 
  Truckload Price $1,944.00 $2,592.00 

  
Number of pallets per truckload/SF per 
pallet 

18 PALLETS/450 SF PER PALLET 18 PALLETS/450 SF PER PALLET 

      
ITEM 78 BERMUDA TIFGREEN 328 

   PRIMARY SECONDARY 

   
TROPICAL LANDSCAPING & LAWN MAINTENANCE, INC. 

(Homestead, FL) 
SUNSET SOD, INC.(Miami, FL.) 

  Truckload Rate per SF $0.60 $0.90 
  Truckload Price $4,860.00 $6,480.00 

  
Number of pallets per truckload/SF per 
pallet 

18 PALLETS/450 SF PER PALLET 18 PALLETS/400 SF PER PALLET 
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ITEM 79 BERMUDA CELEBRATION 

   PRIMARY SECONDARY 

   
TROPICAL LANDSCAPING & LAWN MAINTENANCE, INC. 

(Homestead, FL) 

ODUM'S SOD, INC.(Loxahatchee, 
FL.) 

  Truckload Rate per SF $0.28 $0.32 
  Truckload Price $2,268.00 $2,560.00 

  
Number of pallets per truckload/SF per 
pallet 

18 PALLETS/450 SF PER PALLET 16 PALLETS/ (500) 8,000 SF PER 
PALLET 

      
ITEM 80 BERMUDA TIF DWARF 

   PRIMARY SECONDARY 

   
TROPICAL LANDSCAPING & LAWN MAINTENANCE, INC. 

(Homestead, FL) 
SUNSET SOD, INC.(Miami, FL.) 

  Truckload Rate per SF $0.76 $0.90 
  Truckload Price $6,080.00 $6,480.00 

  
Number of pallets per truckload/SF per 
pallet 

16 PALLETS/500 SF PER PALLET 18 PALLETS/400 SF PER PALLET 

      
ITEM 81 PASPALUM SEA DWARF 

   PRIMARY PRIMARY (TIE) 

   
TROPICAL LANDSCAPING & LAWN MAINTENANCE, INC. 

(Homestead, FL) 
SUNSET SOD, INC.(Miami, FL.) 

  Truckload Rate per SF $0.65 $0.65 
  Truckload Price $4,680.00 $4,680.00 

  
Number of pallets per truckload/SF per 
pallet 

18 PALLETS/400 SF PER PALLET 18 PALLETS/400 SF PER PALLET 

      
ITEM 82 SEALSLE SUPREME PASPALUM CERTIFIED 

   PRIMARY SECONDARY 

   SOUTH FLORIDA GRASSING, INC. (Hobe Sound, FL) 

TROPICAL LANDSCAPING & 
LAWN MAINTENANCE, INC. 

(Homestead, FL) 
  Truckload Rate per SF $0.468 $0.50 
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  Truckload Price $3,744.00 $3,600.00 

  
Number of pallets per truckload/SF per 
pallet 

16 PALLETS/500 SF PER PALLET 18 PALLETS/400 SF PER PALLET 

      
ITEM 83 ULTIMATE FLORA® ZOYSIA 

   PRIMARY SECONDARY 

   MULLINGS ENGINEERING SERVICES, LLC (Sunrise, FL.) 
SUNSET SOD, INC.(Miami, FL.) 

  Truckload Rate per SF $0.45 $0.50 
  Truckload Price $3,645.00 $3,600.00 

  
Number of pallets per truckload/SF per 
pallet 

18 PALLETS/450 SF PER PALLET 18 PALLETS/400 SF PER PALLET 

      
ITEM 84 HAMMOCK® CENTIPEDE 

   PRIMARY SECONDARY 

   
SUNSET SOD, INC.(Miami, FL.) 

TROPICAL LANDSCAPING & 
LAWN MAINTENANCE, INC. 

(Homestead, FL) 
  Truckload Rate per SF $0.51 $0.65 
  Truckload Price $3,672.00 $4,680.00 

  
Number of pallets per truckload/SF per 
pallet 

18 PALLETS/400 SF PER PALLET 18 PALLETS/400 SF PER PALLET 

      
ITEM 85 WILDFLOWER SOD 

   PRIMARY SECONDARY 
  Truckload Rate per SF NO BID  NO BID  
  Truckload Price NO BID  NO BID  

  
Number of pallets per truckload/SF per 
pallet 

NO BID  NO BID  

     
GROUP 11 ADDITIONAL DISCOUNT - IF AWARDED ENTIRE BID - NONE  
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SOUTH 
      

GROUP 15      
 ST. AUGUSTINE FLORATAM 

ITEM 72  PRIMARY SECONDARY 

  
SUNSET SOD, INC.(Miami, FL.) 

TROPICAL LANDSCAPING & 
LAWN MAINTENANCE, INC. 

(Homestead, FL) 

 Truckload Rate per SF $0.248 $0.2596 
 Truckload Price $2,232.00 $2,336.40 

 
Number of pallets per truckload/SF per 
pallet 

18 PALLETS/ 500 SF PER PALLET 
18 PALLETS/ 500 SF PER 

PALLET 
     

ITEM 73 ST. AUGUSTINE PALMETTO 
  PRIMARY SECONDARY 

  
SUNSET SOD, INC.(Miami, FL.) 

TROPICAL LANDSCAPING & 
LAWN MAINTENANCE, INC. 

(Homestead, FL) 

 Truckload Rate per SF $0.258 $0.2596 
 Truckload Price $2,322.00 $2,336.40 

 
Number of pallets per truckload/SF per 
pallet 

18 PALLETS/ 500 SF PER PALLET 18 PALLETS/ 500 SF PER 
PALLET 

     
ITEM 74 BAHIA ARGENTINE 

  PRIMARY SECONDARY 

  
TROPICAL LANDSCAPING & LAWN MAINTENANCE, INC. 

(Homestead, FL) 
SUNSET SOD, INC.(Miami, FL.) 

 Truckload Rate per SF $0.177 $0.198 
 Truckload Price $1,433.70 $1,425.60 

 
Number of pallets per truckload/SF per 
pallet 

18 PALLETS/450 SF PER PALLET 
18 PALLETS/400 SF PER 

PALLET 
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ITEM 75 BAHIA PENSACOLA 

  PRIMARY SECONDARY 

  
TROPICAL LANDSCAPING & LAWN MAINTENANCE, INC. 

(Homestead, FL) 
SUNSET SOD, INC.(Miami, FL.) 

 Truckload Rate per SF $0.177 $0.198 
 Truckload Price $1,433.70 $1,425.60 

 
Number of pallets per truckload/SF per 
pallet 

18 PALLETS/450 SF PER PALLET 
18 PALLETS/400 SF PER 

PALLET 
     

ITEM 76 BERMUDA TIFWAY 419 "CERTIFIED" 
  PRIMARY SECONDARY 

  
TROPICAL LANDSCAPING & LAWN MAINTENANCE, INC. 

(Homestead, FL) 

MULLINGS ENGINEERING 
SERVICES, LLC (Sunrise, FL.) 

 Truckload Rate per SF $0.25 $0.32 
 Truckload Price $2,025.00 $2,592.00 

 
Number of pallets per truckload/SF per 
pallet 

18 PALLETS/ 450 SF PER PALLET 
18 PALLETS/ 450 SF PER 

PALLET 

     
ITEM 77 BERMUDA TIFWAY 419 "UNCERTIFIED"  

  PRIMARY SECONDARY 

  
TROPICAL LANDSCAPING & LAWN MAINTENANCE, INC. 

(Homestead, FL) 

MULLINGS ENGINEERING 
SERVICES, LLC (Sunrise, FL.) 

 Truckload Rate per SF $0.24 $0.32 
 Truckload Price $1,944.00 $2,592.00 

 
Number of pallets per truckload/SF per 
pallet 

18 PALLETS/450 SF PER PALLET 
18 PALLETS/ 450 SF PER 

PALLET 
     

ITEM 78 BERMUDA TIFGREEN 328 
  PRIMARY SECONDARY 

  
TROPICAL LANDSCAPING & LAWN MAINTENANCE, INC. 

(Homestead, FL) 
SUNSET SOD, INC.(Miami, FL.) 

 Truckload Rate per SF $0.60 $0.85 
 Truckload Price $4,860.00 $6,120.00 
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Number of pallets per truckload/SF per 
pallet 

18 PALLETS/450 SF PER PALLET 18 PALLETS/400 SF PER 
PALLET 

     
ITEM 79 BERMUDA CELEBRATION 

  PRIMARY SECONDARY 

  
TROPICAL LANDSCAPING & LAWN MAINTENANCE, INC. 

(Homestead, FL) 

MULLINGS ENGINEERING 
SERVICES, LLC (Sunrise, FL.) 

 Truckload Rate per SF $0.28 $0.33 
 Truckload Price $2,268.00 $2,673.00 

 
Number of pallets per truckload/SF per 
pallet 

18 PALLETS/450 SF PER PALLET 18 PALLETS/450 SF PER 
PALLET 

     
ITEM 80 BERMUDA TIF DWARF 

  PRIMARY SECONDARY 

  
TROPICAL LANDSCAPING & LAWN MAINTENANCE, INC. 

(Homestead, FL) 
SUNSET SOD, INC.(Miami, FL.) 

 Truckload Rate per SF $0.76 $0.86 
 Truckload Price $6,080.00 $6,192.00 

 
Number of pallets per truckload/SF per 
pallet 

16 PALLETS/500 SF PER PALLET 18 PALLETS/400 SF PER 
PALLET 

     
ITEM 81 PASPALUM SEA DWARF 

  PRIMARY SECONDARY 

  
SUNSET SOD, INC.(Miami, FL.) 

TROPICAL LANDSCAPING & 
LAWN MAINTENANCE, INC. 

(Homestead, FL) 
 Truckload Rate per SF $0.64 $0.65 
 Truckload Price $4,608.00 $4,680.00 

 
Number of pallets per truckload/SF per 
pallet 

18 PALLETS/400 SF PER PALLET 18 PALLETS/400 SF PER 
PALLET 
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ITEM 82 SEALSLE SUPREME PASPALUM CERTIFIED 

  PRIMARY SECONDARY 

  SOUTH FLORIDA GRASSING, INC. (Hobe Sound, FL) 

TROPICAL LANDSCAPING & 
LAWN MAINTENANCE, INC. 

(Homestead, FL) 
 Truckload Rate per SF $0.478 $0.50 
 Truckload Price $3,824.00 $3,600.00 

 
Number of pallets per truckload/SF per 
pallet 

16 PALLETS/500 SF PER PALLET 18 PALLETS/400 SF PER 
PALLET 

     
ITEM 83 ULTIMATE FLORA® ZOYSIA 

  PRIMARY SECONDARY 

  MULLINGS ENGINEERING SERVICES, LLC (Sunrise, FL.) SUNSET SOD, INC.(Miami, FL.) 

 Truckload Rate per SF $0.45 $0.49 
 Truckload Price $3,645.00 $3,528.00 

 
Number of pallets per truckload/SF per 
pallet 

18 PALLETS/450 SF PER PALLET 18 PALLETS/400 SF PER 
PALLET 

     
ITEM 84 HAMMOCK® CENTIPEDE 

  PRIMARY SECONDARY 

  
SUNSET SOD, INC.(Miami, FL.) 

TROPICAL LANDSCAPING & 
LAWN MAINTENANCE, INC. 

(Homestead, FL) 
 Truckload Rate per SF $0.499 $0.65 
 Truckload Price $3,592.80 $4,680.00 

 
Number of pallets per truckload/SF per 
pallet 

18 PALLETS/400 SF PER PALLET 
18 PALLETS/400 SF PER 

PALLET 

     
ITEM 85 WILDFLOWER SOD 

  PRIMARY SECONDARY 
 Truckload Rate per SF NO BID  NO BID  
 Truckload Price NO BID  NO BID  

 
Number of pallets per truckload/SF per 
pallet NO BID  

NO BID  

    
GROUP 11 ADDITIONAL DISCOUNT - IF AWARDED ENTIRE BID - NONE  
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CENTRAL 
     

GROUP 15     
 ST. AUGUSTINE FLORATAM 

ITEM 72  PRIMARY SECONDARY 

  
SUNSET SOD, INC.(Miami, FL.) 

TROPICAL LANDSCAPING & 
LAWN MAINTENANCE, INC. 

(Homestead, FL) 
 Truckload Rate per SF $0.249 $0.2596 
 Truckload Price $2,241.00 $2,336.40 

 
Number of pallets per truckload/SF per 
pallet 

18 PALLETS/ 500 SF PER PALLET 18 PALLETS/ 500 SF PER PALLET 

     
ITEM 73 ST. AUGUSTINE PALMETTO 

  PRIMARY SECONDARY 

  
SUNSET SOD, INC.(Miami, FL.) 

TROPICAL LANDSCAPING & 
LAWN MAINTENANCE, INC. 

(Homestead, FL) 
 Truckload Rate per SF $0.259 $0.2596 
 Truckload Price $2,331.00 $2,336.40 

 
Number of pallets per truckload/SF per 
pallet 

18 PALLETS/ 500 SF PER PALLET 18 PALLETS/ 500 SF PER PALLET 

     
ITEM 74 BAHIA ARGENTINE 

  PRIMARY SECONDARY 

  
TROPICAL LANDSCAPING & LAWN MAINTENANCE, INC. 

(Homestead, FL) 
SUNSET SOD, INC.(Miami, FL.) 

 Truckload Rate per SF $0.177 $0.199 
 Truckload Price $1,433.70 $1,432.00 

 
Number of pallets per truckload/SF per 
pallet 

18 PALLETS/450 SF PER PALLET 18 PALLETS/400 SF PER PALLET 

     
     

ITEM 75 BAHIA PENSACOLA 
  PRIMARY SECONDARY 
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TROPICAL LANDSCAPING & LAWN MAINTENANCE, INC. 

(Homestead, FL) 
SUNSET SOD, INC.(Miami, FL.) 

 Truckload Rate per SF $0.177 $0.199 
 Truckload Price $1,433.70 $1,432.80 

 
Number of pallets per truckload/SF per 
pallet 

18 PALLETS/450 SF PER PALLET 18 PALLETS/400 SF PER PALLET 

     
ITEM 76 BERMUDA TIFWAY 419 "CERTIFIED" 

  PRIMARY SECONDARY 

  
TROPICAL LANDSCAPING & LAWN MAINTENANCE, INC. 

(Homestead, FL) 

MULLINGS ENGINEERING 
SERVICES, LLC (Sunrise, FL.) 

 Truckload Rate per SF $0.25 $0.32 
 Truckload Price $2,025.00 $2,592.00 

 
Number of pallets per truckload/SF per 
pallet 

18 PALLETS/ 450 SF PER PALLET 18 PALLETS/450 SF PER PALLET 

     
ITEM 77 BERMUDA TIFWAY 419 "UNCERTIFIED"  

  PRIMARY SECONDARY 

  
TROPICAL LANDSCAPING & LAWN MAINTENANCE, INC. 

(Homestead, FL) 

MULLINGS ENGINEERING 
SERVICES, LLC (Sunrise, FL.) 

 Truckload Rate per SF $0.24 $0.32 
 Truckload Price $1,944.00 $2,592.00 

 
Number of pallets per truckload/SF per 
pallet 

18 PALLETS/450 SF PER PALLET 18 PALLETS/ 450 SF PER PALLET 

     
ITEM 78 BERMUDA TIFGREEN 328 

  PRIMARY SECONDARY 

  
TROPICAL LANDSCAPING & LAWN MAINTENANCE, INC. 

(Homestead, FL) 
SUNSET SOD, INC.(Miami, FL.) 

 Truckload Rate per SF $0.60 $0.85 
 Truckload Price $4,860.00 $6,120.00 

 
Number of pallets per truckload/SF per 
pallet 

18 PALLETS/450 SF PER PALLET 18 PALLETS/400 SF PER PALLET 
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ITEM 79 BERMUDA CELEBRATION 
  PRIMARY SECONDARY 

  
TROPICAL LANDSCAPING & LAWN MAINTENANCE, INC. 

(Homestead, FL) 

MULLINGS ENGINEERING 
SERVICES, LLC (Sunrise, FL.) 

 Truckload Rate per SF $0.28 $0.33 
 Truckload Price $2,268.00 $2,673.00 

 
Number of pallets per truckload/SF per 
pallet 

18 PALLETS/450 SF PER PALLET 18 PALLETS/450 SF PER PALLET 

     
ITEM 80 BERMUDA TIF DWARF 

  PRIMARY SECONDARY 

  
TROPICAL LANDSCAPING & LAWN MAINTENANCE, INC. 

(Homestead, FL) 
SUNSET SOD, INC.(Miami, FL.) 

 Truckload Rate per SF $0.76 $0.86 
 Truckload Price $6,080.00 $6,192.00 

 
Number of pallets per truckload/SF per 
pallet 

16 PALLETS/500 SF PER PALLET 18 PALLETS/400 SF PER PALLET 

     
ITEM 81 PASPALUM SEA DWARF 

  PRIMARY SECONDARY 

  
SUNSET SOD, INC.(Miami, FL.) 

TROPICAL LANDSCAPING & 
LAWN MAINTENANCE, INC. 

(Homestead, FL) 
 Truckload Rate per SF $0.64 $0.65 
 Truckload Price $4,608.00 $4,680.00 

 
Number of pallets per truckload/SF per 
pallet 

18 PALLETS/400 SF PER PALLET 18 PALLETS/400 SF PER PALLET 

     
ITEM 82 SEALSLE SUPREME PASPALUM CERTIFIED 

  PRIMARY SECONDARY 

  SOUTH FLORIDA GRASSING, INC. (Hobe Sound, FL) 

TROPICAL LANDSCAPING & 
LAWN MAINTENANCE, INC. 

(Homestead, FL) 
 Truckload Rate per SF $0.47 $0.50 
 Truckload Price $3,760.00 $3,600.00 
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Number of pallets per truckload/SF per 
pallet 

16 PALLETS/500 SF PER PALLET 18 PALLETS/400 SF PER PALLET 

     
ITEM 83 ULTIMATE FLORA® ZOYSIA 

  PRIMARY SECONDARY 

  MULLINGS ENGINEERING SERVICES, LLC (Sunrise, FL.) SUNSET SOD, INC.(Miami, FL.) 

 Truckload Rate per SF $0.45 $0.49 
 Truckload Price $3,645.00 $3,528.00 

 
Number of pallets per truckload/SF per 
pallet 

18 PALLETS/450 SF PER PALLET 18 PALLETS/400 SF PER PALLET 

     
ITEM 84 HAMMOCK® CENTIPEDE 

  PRIMARY SECONDARY 

  
SUNSET SOD, INC.(Miami, FL.) 

TROPICAL LANDSCAPING & 
LAWN MAINTENANCE, INC. 

(Homestead, FL) 
 Truckload Rate per SF $0.499 $0.65 
 Truckload Price $3,592.80 $4,680.00 

 
Number of pallets per truckload/SF per 
pallet 

18 PALLETS/400 SF PER PALLET 18 PALLETS/400 SF PER PALLET 

     
ITEM 85 WILDFLOWER SOD 

  PRIMARY SECONDARY 
 Truckload Rate per SF NO BID  NO BID  
 Truckload Price NO BID  NO BID  

 
Number of pallets per truckload/SF per 
pallet 

NO BID  NO BID  

     
GROUP 11 ADDITIONAL DISCOUNT - IF AWARDED ENTIRE BID - NONE  
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SOD AND SOD INSTALLATION – TALLY SHEET 

  "Offers from the vendors listed herein are the only offers 

BID DUE DATE: AUGUST 29, 2012  received timely as of the above receiving date and time. 

BID: DUE TIME: 2:30 P.M.  All other offers submitted in response to this solicitation, 

BID No.:  066-2730-12/DJL  if any, are hereby rejected as late"  

      

VENDORS 
MULLINGS ENGINEERING 

SERVICES, LLC ODUM'S SOD, INC.  SOUTH FLORIDA GRASSING, INC. 
  6289 W. Sunrise Blvd, #122 13961 Okeechobee Blvd P.O. BOX 725 
  Sunrise, Florida 33313 Loxahatchee, Florida 33470 Hobe Sound, Florida 33475 
  Attn: Sheldon Mullings Attn: James Hammond Attn: Homer Greene 
  Phone: 954-583-2441 Phone: 561-333-7416 Phone: 772-546-4191 
  Fax: 866-558-0486 Fax: 561-333-7455 Fax: 772-546-3482 
  mullingseng@hotmail.com  odumssod@yahoo.com  sfgrassing@yahoo.com  
ORIGINAL AND THREE (3) COPIES       
SUBMITTED YES YES YES 
        
BIDDER'S ACKNOWLEDGEMENT YES YES YES 
        
SCHEDULE OF BID PRICES YES YES YES 
        
BIDDER'S QUALIFICATION STATEMENT       
SUBMITTED YES YES YES 
        
SCHEDULE OF SUBCONTRACTORS      
SUBMITTED YES/NONE IDENTIFIED YES/NONE IDENTIFIED YES/NONE IDENTIFIED 
        
ACKNOWLEDGEMENT OF ADDENDA       
(NONE ISSUED) YES YES YES 
        
NON COLLUSION AFFIDAVIT SUBMITTED YES YES YES 
        
ANTI-KICKBACK AFFIDAVIT SUBMITTED YES YES YES 
        
CONFIRMATION OF MINORITY OWNED        
BUSINESS SUBMITTED YES/MINORITY FIRM YES/MINORITY FIRM YES/NOT MINORITY FIRM 
        
CONFIRMATION OF DRUG FREE        

mailto:mullingseng@hotmail.com�
mailto:odumssod@yahoo.com�
mailto:sfgrassing@yahoo.com�
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WORKPLACE SUBMITTED YES YES/DOES NOT HAVE A DRUG-FREE  YES 
    PROGRAM IN PLACE   
WARRANTIES ACKNOWLEDGEMENT        
SUBMITTED YES YES  YES 
        
PALM BEACH COUNTY INSPECTOR        
GENERAL ACKNOWLEDGEMENT YES YES YES 
        
PROOF OF INSURANCE SUBMITTED YES YES NO 
       
OCCUPATIONAL LICENSE SUBMITTED  YES/BUSINESS TAX RECEIPT YES/BUSINESS TAX RECEIPT NO 
        
COMMENTS:       
      BUSINESS TAX RECEIPT AND 
      PROOF OF INSURANCE RECEIVED 
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SOD AND SOD INSTALLATION – TALLY SHEET 
  "Offers from the vendors listed herein are the only offers 

BID DUE DATE: AUGUST 29, 2012  received timely as of the above receiving date and time. 

BID: DUE TIME: 2:30 P.M.  All other offers submitted in response to this solicitation, 

BID No.:  066-2730-12/DJL  if any, are hereby rejected as late"  

     

VENDORS SUNSET SOD, INC.  
TROPICAL LANDSCAPING & LAWN MAINTENANCE, 

INC.    
  P.O. BOX 160744 17973 S.W. 248th Street   
  Miami, Florida 33116 Homestead, Florida 33031   
  Attn: Kathleen Hernandez Attn: Joann Sharpe   
  Phone: 305-253-2002 Phone: 305-245-4144   
  FAX: 786-242-9988 Fax: 305-245-3109   
  kathy@sunsetsod.net  tropiclsn@aol.com    
ORIGINAL AND THREE (3) COPIES       
SUBMITTED YES YES   
        
BIDDER'S ACKNOWLEDGEMENT YES YES   
        
SCHEDULE OF BID PRICES YES YES   
        
BIDDER'S QUALIFICATION STATEMENT       
SUBMITTED YES YES   
        
SCHEDULE OF SUBCONTRACTORS      
SUBMITTED YES/NONE IDENTIFIED YES/NONE IDENTIFIED    
        
ACKNOWLEDGEMENT OF ADDENDA       
(NONE ISSUED) YES YES   
        
NON COLLUSION AFFIDAVIT SUBMITTED YES YES   
        
ANTI-KICKBACK AFFIDAVIT SUBMITTED YES YES   
        
CONFIRMATION OF MINORITY OWNED       
BUSINESS SUBMITTED YES/MINORITY FIRM YES/MINORITY FIRM   
        
CONFIRMATION OF DRUG FREE        
WORKPLACE SUBMITTED YES YES   

mailto:kathy@sunsetsod.net�
mailto:tropiclsn@aol.com�
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WARRANTIES ACKNOWLEDGEMENT        
SUBMITTED YES YES   
        
PALM BEACH COUNTY INSPECTOR        
GENERAL ACKNOWLEDGEMENT YES YES   
        
PROOF OF INSURANCE SUBMITTED NO NO   
        
OCCUPATIONAL LICENSE SUBMITTED  YES/BUSINESS TAX RECEIPT NO   
        
COMMENTS:       
  Certificate of Insurance Received  COPY OF DRIVER'S LICENSE FOR    
  showing proof of insurance. DAVID SANTANA   
        
    Certificate of Insurance received   
    along w/Business Tax receipt   
        
        

 


