

RESOLUTION No. 2009-101-1046

A RESOLUTION OF THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF MIAMI GARDENS, FLORIDA, AWARDED A BID TO DON REID FORD IN THE AMOUNT OF ONE HUNDRED FIFTY SEVEN THOUSAND, FIVE HUNDRED NINETY THREE DOLLARS (\$157,593.00) FOR THE PURCHASE OF CITY VEHICLES ALONG WITH EXTENDED WARRANTIES AND AUTHORIZING THE CITY MANAGER TO ISSUE A PURCHASE ORDER FOR THIS PURPOSE; PROVIDING FOR THE ADOPTION OF REPRESENTATIONS; PROVIDING AN EFFECTIVE DATE.

WHEREAS, January 2009, the City Council authorized the issuance of a bond in the amount of Two Million Dollars (\$2,000,000.00) for the purchase of City vehicles, and

WHEREAS, multiple departments within the City are in need of new vehicles, and

WHEREAS, city staff prepared specifications for the purchase and delivery of various vehicles, and

WHEREAS, bids were publicly read on April 9, 2009, and

WHEREAS, the City would like to award a bid to Don Reid Ford for the purchase of two (2) E-350 Club Wagons, one (1) Ford F-150 Crew Cab 4x2 Trucks, one (1) Ford F-250 ¾ Ton Crew Cab Truck, one (1) Ford F-450 1.5 Ton Crew Cab Dump Truck and one (1) Ford Explorer, and

WHEREAS, Don Reid Ford was the low bidder for the referenced vehicles,

NOW THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF MIAMI GARDENS, FLORIDA, AS FOLLOWS:

Section 1. ADOPTION OF REPRESENTATIONS: The foregoing Whereas paragraphs are hereby ratified and confirmed as being true, and the same are hereby made a specific part of this Resolution.

Section 2. AUTHORIZATION: The City Council of the City of Miami Gardens hereby awards a bid to Don Reid Ford in the amount of One Hundred Fifty Seven Thousand, Five Ninety Three Dollars(\$157,593.00) for the purchase of two (2) E-350 Club Wagons, one (1) Ford F-150 Crew Cab 4x2 Trucks, one (1) Ford F-250 ¾ Ton Crew Cab Truck, one (1) Ford F-450 1.5 Ton Crew Cab Dump Truck and one (1) Ford Explorer along with extended warranties and authorizes the City Manager to issue a purchase order for this purpose.

Section 3. EFFECTIVE DATE: This Resolution shall take effect immediately upon its final passage.

PASSED AND ADOPTED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF MIAMI GARDENS AT ITS REGULAR MEETING HELD ON MAY 27, 2009.


SHIRLEY GIBSON, MAYOR

ATTEST:


RONETTA TAYLOR, MMC, CITY CLERK

PREPARED BY: SONJA KNIGHTON DICKENS, ESQ.
City Attorney

SPONSORED BY: DANNY CREW, CITY MANAGER

MOVED BY: Councilwoman Pritchett
SECONDED BY: Councilman Gilbert

VOTE: 7-0

Mayor Shirley Gibson	<u> x </u> (Yes)	<u> </u> (No)
Vice Mayor Barbara Watson	<u> x </u> (Yes)	<u> </u> (No)
Councilman Melvin L. Bratton	<u> x </u> (Yes)	<u> </u> (No)
Councilman Aaron Campbell	<u> x </u> (Yes)	<u> </u> (No)
Councilman Oliver Gilbert, III	<u> x </u> (Yes)	<u> </u> (No)

Resolution No. 2009-101-1046

Councilwoman Sharon Pritchett
Councilman André Williams

(Yes) (No)
 (Yes) (No)

SKD/teh
8481326_1.DOC



1515 NW 167 Street, Building 5 Suite 200
Miami Gardens, Florida 33169

City of Miami Gardens Agenda Cover Memo

Council Meeting Date:	May 27, 2009		Item Type:	Resolution	Ordinance	Other	
			<i>(Enter X in box)</i>	X			
Fiscal Impact: <i>(Enter X in box)</i>	Yes	No	Ordinance Reading: <i>(Enter X in box)</i>	1st Reading		2nd Reading	
	X			Public Hearing: <i>(Enter X in box)</i>	Yes	No	Yes
Funding Source:	Fleet Services - Equipment Bond		Advertising Requirement: <i>(Enter X in box)</i>	Yes		No	
						X	
Contract/P.O. Required: <i>(Enter X in box)</i>	Yes	No	RFP/RFQ/Bid #:	ITB#08-09-024			
	X						
Sponsor Name	Dr. Danny O. Crew, City Manager		Department:	Fleet Division			

Short Title:

A RESOLUTION OF THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF MIAMI GARDENS, FLORIDA, AWARDING A BID TO DON REID FORD IN THE AMOUNT OF ONE HUNDRED FIFTY SEVEN THOUSAND, FIVE HUNDRED NINETY THREE DOLLARS (\$157,593.00) FOR THE PURCHASE OF CITY VEHICLES ALONG WITH EXTENDED WARRANTIES AND AUTHORIZING THE CITY MANAGER TO ISSUE A PURCHASE ORDER FOR THIS PURPOSE; PROVIDING FOR THE ADOPTION OF REPRESENTATIONS; PROVIDING AN EFFECTIVE DATE.

Staff Summary:

The City Council authorized bond financing in the amount of \$2 million for the purchase of additional vehicles and equipment in January 2009, in order to enhance the general citywide operations.

Vehicles that were approved as part of the Fiscal Year 2009 budget are:

- Public Works Department

One (1) 2009 Ford F-450 1.5 ton Crew Cab Dump Truck

One (1) 2009 Ford F-150 4x2 Truck

One (1) 2009 Ford F-150 Crew Cab 4x2 Truck

One (1) 2009 F-250 ¾ ton Crew Cab Truck
- Parks and Recreation Department

Two (2) 2009 Ford E-350 Club Wagons

**ITEM J-1) CONSENT AGENDA
RESOLUTION
Awarding a bid to Don Reid Ford**

- Fleet Services Division One (1) 2009 Ford F-250 ¾ ton Utility Truck
- Information Technology Department One (1) 2009 Ford F-150 4x2 Truck
- Information Technology Department One (1) 2009 Ford Explorer 4x2

Of the nine (9) of budgeted vehicles listed above, only the purchase of six (6) are being presented to Council for approval for purchase. The remaining three (3) vehicles were purchased under the City Manager's authority, from the lowest responsible responsive bidders:

- Tropical Ford, Orlando Two (2) 2009 Ford F-150 4x2 Trucks
- Prestige Ford, Mount Dora One (1) 2009 Ford F-250 ¾ ton Utility Truck

Bid #08-09-024 was advertised on February 26, 2009. A broadcast notice was sent to 274 vendors. Thirty vendors requested bid packages. The bids were opened on April 9, 2009. Six bids were received and publicity read. A copy of the bid document and submittals are available at the Assistant to the Mayor and Council's office for review. Staff is recommending award for the purchase of six vehicles in the amount of \$157,593, to the lowest responsible responsive bidder Don Reid Ford. The tabulation sheet is attached as Exhibit "A".

Proposed Action:

That the City Council authorize the City Manager to issue a purchase order to Don Reid Ford, located in Maitland, Florida in the amount of \$157,593.00, which includes the extended warranties, for six (6) vehicles which include; two (2) E-350 Club Wagons, one (1) Ford F-150 Crew Cab 4x2 Truck, one (1) Ford F-250 ¾ ton Crew Cab Truck, one (1) Ford F-450 1.5 ton Crew Cab Dump Truck and one (1) Ford Explorer 4x2.

Attachment:

Attachment A – Tabulation Price Sheet



City of Miami Gardens
 1515 N.W. 167th Street: Bldg. 5 Suite 200
 Miami Gardens, Florida 33169

Procurement Department Tabulation Sheet
 ITB#08-09-024 Purchase of 2009 Fleet Vehicles

Vehicles complete per specifications	EST QTY	Gus Machado Ford	Tropical Ford	Maroone Ford of Ft. Lauderdale	Rechtien International Trucks Inc.	Don Reid Ford	Prestige Ford
2009 FORD E-350 CLUB WAGON EXTENDED - 4X2	2 ea	\$22,666.00	\$22,067.00	\$23,954.00	No Bid	\$22,975.00	\$22,349.00
3.2 REQUIRED OPTIONS		\$3,210.00	\$3,690.00	\$3,290.00	No Bid	Included	\$1,234.00
2009 FORD F-150 PICKUP TRUCK - 4X2 Base Vehicle	2 ea	\$14,100.00	\$13,813.00	15,856.00	No Bid	17,761.00	\$14,185.00
3.3 REQUIRED OPTIONS		\$4,726.00	\$3,875.00	\$4,321.00	No Bid	Included	\$3,909.00
2009 FORD F-150 CREW CAB - 4X2 Base Vehicle	2 ea	\$20,506.00	\$20,184.00	\$22,409.00	No Bid	22,497.00	\$20,545.00
3.4 REQUIRED OPTIONS		\$3,970.00	\$3,195.00	\$4,321.00	No Bid	Included	\$3,324.00
2009 FORD F-250 3/4 TON UTILITY PICKUP TRUCK	1 ea	\$16,884.00	\$20,023.00	\$17,677.00	No Bid	23,870.00	\$16,868.00
3.5 REQUIRED OPTIONS		\$8,280.00	\$4,440.00	\$8,740.00	No Bid	Included	\$3,739.00
2009 FORD F-250 3/4 TON CREW CAB Base Vehicle	1 ea	\$19,111.00	\$19,190.00	\$20,636.00	No Bid	22,591.00	\$19,264.00
3.6 REQUIRED OPTIONS		\$4,646.00	\$3,625.00	\$4,406.00	No Bid	Included	\$3,884.00
2009 FORD F450 1.5 TON CREW CAB DUMP TRUCK DUAL REAR WHEEL 4X2	1 ea	\$No Bid	\$32,132.00	\$33,950.00	\$63,096.28	46,560.00	\$32,449.00
3.7 REQUIRED OPTIONS		\$No Bid	\$14,690.00	\$14,862.00	Included	Included	\$14,761.00
2009 Ford Explorer 4 X2	1 ea	\$19,586.00	\$19,401.00	\$19,986.00	No Bid	19,995.00	\$19,787.00
3.8 REQUIRED OPTIONS		\$1,135.00	\$815.00	\$1,335.00	No Bid	Included	\$865.00

This is only a tabulation of prices submitted and is not an indication of award or responsiveness